
 

 

AGENDA 
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

                 TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2013, 7:00 P. M.                                                  
SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

245 E. BONITA AVENUE 
 

  
CITY COUNCIL: 
Mayor Curtis W. Morris 
Mayor Pro Tem Denis Bertone  
Councilmember Emmett Badar 
Councilmember John Ebiner  
Councilmember Jeff Templeman 
 
1. CALL TO ORDER AND FLAG SALUTE 

 
2. ANNOUNCEMENTS 
 

 Holiday Extravaganza December 7, 2013 
 
3. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS (Members of the audience are invited to address the City Council on 

any item not on the agenda.  Under the provisions of the Brown Act, the legislative body is prohibited 
from taking or engaging in discussion on any item not appearing on the posted agenda.  However, 
your concerns may be referred to staff or set for discussion at a later date.  If you desire to address the 
City Council on an item on this agenda, other than a scheduled public hearing item you may do so at 
this time or asked to be heard when that agenda item is considered.  Comments on public hearing 
items will be considered when that item is scheduled for discussion.  The Public Comment period is 
limited to 30 minutes.  Each speaker shall be limited to three (3) minutes.) 

 
a. Members of the Audience 

 
4. CONSENT CALENDAR 

(All items on the Consent Calendar are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one motion 
unless a member of the City Council requests separate discussion.) 
 

 a. Resolutions read by title, further reading waived, passage and adoption recommended as follows: 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2013 - 57, A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, APPROVING CERTAIN DEMANDS FOR 
THE MONTH OF NOVEMBER, 2013. 

 
b. Approval of minutes for regular City Council meeting of November 12, 2013, Study Session 

October 22, 2013 and City Council/Staff Retreat October 28, 2013. 
 
c. MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT AMENDMENT 13-05 - Consideration of a Municipal Code Text 

Amendment to allow a limited number of household chickens in conjunction with a single-family 
detached residence in all residential zones and specific plans that allow single-family detached 
residential uses, and other minor miscellaneous edits.  

 
ORDINANCE NO. 1226 - AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS ADOPTING MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT AMENDMENT  
13-05, AMENDING CHAPTERS 18.08, 18.16, AND 18.20 OF THE SAN DIMAS 
MUNICIPAL ZONING CODE - SECOND READING AND ADOPTION 
      

END OF CONSENT CALENDAR 



City Council Agenda 
November 26, 2013                                                                                                                                            Page 2 
 
 
 
5. PLANNING 
 
 a. Introduction and first reading of Uniform Building Codes and set December 10, 2013 as date for 

public hearing and adoption. 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 1227, AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF SAN DIMAS AMENDING SPECIFIED CHAPTERS OF TITLE 15 OF THE SAN 
DIMAS MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013 
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, VOLUMES 1 & 2, THE 2013 
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF 
THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN 
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS, INCLUDING 
FEES AND PENALTIES - FIRST READING AND INTRODUCTION 

       
6. OTHER BUSINESS  
 
       a. Extension of the Agreement with the University of La Verne for the Management of the 

 City’s Government/Education Access Channel 
 
 b. Request from Waste Management for Refuse Service Rate Increase 
 
7. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS 
 
 a. Members of the Audience (Speakers are limited to five (5) minutes or as may be determined by 

the Chair.) 
 

b. City Manager 
 

c. City Attorney 
 

d. Members of the City Council 
 
  1)   Councilmembers' report on meetings attended at the expense of the local agency. 
 
  2)  Individual Members' comments and update 
 
10. ADJOURNMENT 
 

The next meeting will be Tuesday, December 10, 2013 at 7:00 p.m.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 



City Council Agenda 
November 26, 2013                                                                                                                                            Page 3 
 
 
AGENDA STAFF REPORTS:  COPIES OF STAFF REPORTS AND/OR OTHER WRITTEN 
DOCUMENTATION PERTAINING TO THE ITEMS ON THE AGENDA ARE ON FILE IN THE 
OFFICE OF THE CITY CLERK AND ARE AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION DURING THE 
HOURS OF 8:00 A.M. TO 5:00 P.M. MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY.  INFORMATION MAY BE 
OBTAINED BY CALLING (909) 394-6216.  CITY COUNCIL MINUTES AND AGENDAS ARE 
ALSO AVAILABLE ON THE CITY’S HOME PAGE ON THE INTERNET:  
http://www.cityofsandimas.com/minutes.cfm.    
 
SUPPLEMENTAL REPORTS:  AGENDA RELATED WRITINGS OR DOCUMENTS PROVIDED 
TO A MAJORITY OF THE SUBJECT BODY AFTER DISTRIBUTION OF THE AGENDA PACKET 
SHALL BE MADE AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION AT THE CITY CLERK'S OFFICE 
DURING NORMAL BUSINESS HOURS. [PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS 
EXEMPTED] 
 
POSTING STATEMENT:  ON NOVEMBER 22, 2013, A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF THIS 
AGENDA WAS POSTED ON THE BULLETIN BOARDS AT 245 EAST BONITA AVENUE (SAN 
DIMAS CITY HALL); 145 NORTH WALNUT AVENUE (LOS ANGELES COUNTY PUBLIC 
LIBRARY, SAN DIMAS BRANCH); AND 300 EAST BONITA AVENUE (UNITED STATES POST 
OFFICE); AT THE VONS SHOPPING CENTER (PUENTE/VIA VERDE) AND THE CITY’S 
WEBSITE AT WWW.CITYOFSANDIMAS.COM/MINUTES.CFM. 

http://cityofsandimas.com/
http://cityofsandimas.com/


RESOLUTION NO 2013-57 
 

   A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
   CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, APPROVING 

  CERTAIN DEMANDS FOR THE MONTH OF NOVEMBER 2013 
 

                   
 
 WHEREAS, the following listed demands have been audited by the Director of Finance; 
and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Director of Finance has certified as to the availability of funds for 
payment thereto; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the register of audited demands have been submitted to the City Council for 
approval. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of San Dimas 
does hereby approve warrant Register: 11/27/13; (146170 - 146279) in the amount of 
$756,631.13. 
 
  

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED THIS 26TH  DAY OF NOVEMBER 2013. 
 
 
 
 
     _______________________________________________ 
     Curtis W. Morris, Mayor of the City of San Dimas 
ATTEST: 
 
 
__________________________ 
Debra Black, Deputy City Clerk 
 
 
 I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by vote of the City 
Council of the City of San Dimas at its regular meeting of November 26th, 2013 by the following 
vote: 
 

AYES: Councilmembers Badar, Bertone, Ebiner, Templeman, Morris 
NOES:  None 
ABSTAIN: None 
ABSENT: Badar 

   
 
      ________________________________ 
      Debra Black, Deputy City Clerk 

4a

























 

MINUTES 
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

                 AND SAN DIMAS HOUSING AUTHORITY 
TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 12, 2013, 7:00 P. M.                                                  

SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 
245 E. BONITA AVENUE 

 
  
CITY COUNCIL: 
Mayor Curtis W. Morris 
Mayor Pro Tem Denis Bertone  
Councilmember Emmett Badar 
Councilmember John Ebiner  
Councilmember Jeff Templeman 
 
STAFF 
City Manager Blaine Michaelis 
City Attorney Ken Brown 
Assistant City Manager of Community Development Larry Stevens 
Assistant City Manager of Administrative Services Ken Duran 
Director of Parks and Recreation Theresa Bruns 
Director of Public Works Krishna Patel 
Deputy City Clerk Debra Black 
Planning Associate Jennifer Williams 
 
1. CALL TO ORDER AND FLAG SALUTE 
 
 Mayor Morris called the meeting to order and led to flag salute at 7:00 p.m. 

 
2. RECOGNITIONS 
 

 Parking Enforcement Officer Joseph Hernandez 
 
 L.A. County Sheriff’s Department Captain Rod Kush presented Parking Enforcement Officer Joseph  
 Hernandez with a Sheriff’s Department Proclamation. 
 
3. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS (Members of the audience are invited to address the City Council on 

any item not on the agenda.  Under the provisions of the Brown Act, the legislative body is prohibited 
from taking or engaging in discussion on any item not appearing on the posted agenda.  However, 
your concerns may be referred to staff or set for discussion at a later date.  If you desire to address the 
City Council on an item on this agenda, other than a scheduled public hearing item you may do so at 
this time or asked to be heard when that agenda item is considered.  Comments on public hearing 
items will be considered when that item is scheduled for discussion.  The Public Comment period is 
limited to 30 minutes.  Each speaker shall be limited to three (3) minutes.) 

 
 1) Frank Neal resident and one of the organizers of the Family Bicycle Day spoke of the success of 
  event. 
 
 2) Cassidy Cuccia-Aguirre ASB President at San Dimas High School provided an update of the 

upcoming activities at the high school. 
 
 3) Amy Crow Manager of the San Dimas Library provided an update of the upcoming activities 

planned at the library. 
 

4b



 4)  Kimberly King resident shared her concerns over the continuing issues with the Trunk or Treat 
event held at Christ’s Church of the Valley. 

 
 5) Richard White invited Council to the ROP Career Job Fair in West Covina. 
 

a. Members of the Audience 
 
4. CONSENT CALENDAR 

(All items on the Consent Calendar are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one motion 
unless a member of the City Council requests separate discussion.) 
 
MOTION: It was moved by Councilmember Bertone seconded by Councilmember Ebiner and 
carried to accept and approve the consent calendar as follows: 
 

 a. Resolutions read by title, further reading waived, passage and adoption recommended as follows: 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2013 - 53, A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, APPROVING CERTAIN DEMANDS FOR 
THE MONTHS OF OCTOBER AND NOVEMBER, 2013. 

 
b. Approval of minutes for regular City Council meeting of October 22, 2013 
 
c. Approve application for grant funds for the Walnut Creek Habitat and Open Space Project – 

Phase 1  
 

 RESOLUTION NO. 2013 - 54, RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA APPROVING THE APPLICATION FOR 
GRANT FUNDS FROM THE LOS ANGELES COUNTY REGIONAL PARK AND 
OPEN SPACE DISTRICT FOR FIFTH SUPERVISORIAL DISTRICT EXCESS 
FUNDING FOR THE WALNUT CREEK HABITAT AND OPEN SPACE  
PROJECT – PHASE 1 

 
       d. Youth Employment Plan Walnut Creek Habitat and Open Space Project – Phase 1 

 
 RESOLUTION NO. 2013 – 55, A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF  

THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS APPROVING A YOUTH EMPLOYMENT PLAN FOR 
THE WALNUT CREEK HABITAT AND OPEN SPACE  
PROJECT – PHASE 1 

 
e. Denial of claim for Daniel Wong/Mercury Insurance 
 
f. Denial of claim for Robert R. Pereira/BP Development, Inc. 
  
END OF CONSENT CALENDAR 
 

5. PUBLIC HEARINGS 
 

a. MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT AMENDMENT 13-05 - Consideration of a Municipal Code Text 
Amendment to allow a limited number of household chickens in conjunction with a single-family 
detached residence in all residential zones and specific plans that allow single-family detached 
residential uses, and other minor miscellaneous edits.  
FIRST READING AND INTRODUCTION 

 



ORDINANCE NO. 1226 - AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF 
THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS ADOPTING MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT 
AMENDMENT 13-05, AMENDING CHAPTERS 18.08, 18.16, AND 18.20 OF 
THE SAN DIMAS MUNICIPAL ZONING CODE   

 
  Associate Planner Jennifer Williams presented staff’s report on this item and recommended 
  adoption of MCTA 13-05. 

 
  Councilmember Bertone asked why staff recommended 5, 000 sq. ft. 
 
   Associate Planner Williams answered that it allows a higher percentage of homes in the city to 
   have chickens. 

 
   Councilmember Badar asked about the average square footage of the homes around the 
   downtown area. 

 
   Associate Planner Williams answered that it is approximately 7500 sq. ft. 
 
   Councilmember Ebiner asked if the setback at the back of the property would still be 5 ft. from 
   property line. 

 
  Associate Planner Williams responded that in most cases it would. 

 
Councilmember Ebiner asked if the properties that back up to Arrow Highway were factored     
into the decision. 

 
  Associate Planner Williams responded that if the sheds for the chickens were under the size for 
  the threshold for building permits residents would still be advised to meet the setbacks 
  requirements. 
 
  Assistant City Manager Stevens added that sheds over six feet tall require building permits,  
  less than six feet do not. He also stated that the Arrow Highway properties are standard single 
  family zone and there is no rear yard requirement; but if some of the parcels are fewer 5,000 sq. 
  ft. then they would not be allowed chickens unless an alteration was made to the minimum lot 
  size standard. 
 
   Mayor Morris opened the public hearing. 

 
1) Kris Tanner resident on Dakota thanked staff for working hard on the ordinance, 

asked Council to consider approval and shared that having the chickens would 
allow her to control what she feeds her high level special needs son. 

 
2) Dr. Marvin Ersher recommended having a permit process with a sunset clause 

instead of a blanket approval for the entire city. 
 

   Mayor Morris closed the public hearing and brought the matter back to the Council. 
 

   Councilmember Ebiner shared some of the benefits of having chickens and recommended  
   changing the lot size to 4500 or 4750 and requiring a building permit for a chicken  
   coop up to 7ft. 



3) Cloud Rainbow Walker explained the hazards as well as the habits and social 
traits of owning chickens. 

 
4) Dr. Ersher asked if the subject of salmonella had been discussed and if there 

would be any educational information about raising chickens shared with the 
public. 

 
     Mayor Morris stated that it had been discussed in the earlier stages of research and neither the 
     Health department or anyone else has had anything to say on the subject. 

 
     Councilmember Ebiner suggested that staff have some material available on the 
     City’s website. 

 
     Councilmember Bertone shared that he would be speaking with Assistant City Manager 
     Ken Duran who is in the process of working with the Humane Society and updating the 
     City’s animal code and regulations. 

 
     Councilmember Badar shared that he is fine with the 3 chicken minimum but asked why 
     staff chose 3. 

 
     Cloud Rainbow Walker stated that hens form pairing bonds and odd numbers don’t work. 
 
     Associate Planner Williams explained that 3 would be in line with the minimum  
     requirement for dogs and cats, etc. 
 
     Councilmember Ebiner asked if there was an interest in lower the lot size to 4750 sq. ft. 
     and amending the height of the chicken coop. 

 
      Templeman answered he didn’t know what the benefit would be. 

 
     Councilmember Ebiner responded that there could be a few more lots included. 

 
     The consensus was that 6 ft. for the chicken coop height and 5000 sq. ft. for the lot size 
     would be appropriate. 

 
MOTION: A motion was made by Councilmember Ebiner seconded by 
 Councilmember Bertone to waive further reading and introduce Ordinance 1226 
 M.C.T.A 13-05. The motion carried unanimously. 
  

6. OTHER BUSINESS 
 
 a. Request from Mr. Roger Jon Diamond to amend section 18.194.030 of the San Dimas Municipal  
  Code to allow one medical marijuana dispensary to operate in the City – City Council direction 
 
     City Manager Blaine Michaelis gave a brief overview of the issue and background on the City’s 
     municipal code with a recommendation to deny the request. 
 
     Mr. Roger Diamond addressed Council with his request for exemption from the City Municipal Code 
     for his client. Mr. Diamond stated the following in support of his request: 

 
 



• California Law - cities do not have to exercise their authority to ban the facilities 
• Some cities have already recognized the need for facilities 
• 1996 voters legalized medical marijuana throughout the state 
• To date no criminal or nuisance activity since the opening at the location 
• Location is best place for this type of facility – owner of properties would not 

want other tenants bothered and would be in position to get rid of the 
dispensary- costs to regulate falls to property owner not the public 

• Owner of center supports the use 
• Under California Law the dispensary has to operate as a legitimate dispensary 

and those in the coop must get approval from a physician  
• Petitions with some San Dimas residents in favor of dispensary 
• Licensed private security guards  

  
Mr. Diamond concluded by asking for the dispensary to operate for a month or two to see if problems 
arise, which he disputes and sees no evidence of. 

 
Councilmember Badar asked Mr. Diamond if he saw a business permit at the location when he visited 
and did the operators try to obtain one. 

 
Mr. Diamond responded by saying the city would not issue one and because they are volunteers not 
businessmen they did not know to go to the city to apply for a business permit. 

 
Councilmember Bertone shared that he agrees with Mr. Diamond and believes that medical marijuana 
has a benefit but because it is against Federal Law cannot support this request.  

 
Mr. Diamond citied cities and states where medical marijuana facilities have approved zones in which 
they are allowed to operate and there has been no Federal prosecution as long as they are in 
compliance. 

 
 Councilman Templeman asked if the use of marijuana allowed at this facility. 

 
 Mr. Diamond answered that there is no consumption at the facility. 

 
 Mr. Templeman then asked if consumption is prohibited. 

 
 Mr. Diamond replied there can be no consumption at the facility. 

 
Councilmember Templeman shared information from writings of past Whittier Police Chief which 
compiled data from other police departments citing the problems that exist when these facilities are in 
neighborhoods. 

 
 Dr. Ersher asked Council to uphold the ordinance and deny the request. 

 
Councilmember Ebiner commented that he is not personally in favor of the issue and not inclined to 
approve the request; however with public opinion changing he could see this matter being reviewed in 
the future. 

 
Emily Stillion shared an experience she had while visiting a shopping center in another city where she 
observed the security officers there for the marijuana dispensary and doesn’t feel it would be a good 
look for our city. 

 
 Jim McCants spoke about his experience with owning property near a marijuana hothouse. 

 
 



 
 b.   Resolution No. 2013-56 providing a 2.5% increase in employee salaries 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2013 – 56, A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS ADOPTING AND EXTENDING THE PAY PLAN AND 
REIMBURSEMENT SCHEDULE FOR CITY EMPLOYEES 

 
City Manager Blaine Michaelis presented staff’s report and background on this item to the Council 
and recommended adoption. 

 
 Councilmember Templeman pointed out that this does not include Councilmembers. 

 
MOTION:  A motion was made to waive further reading and adopt Resolution 2013-56 by 
Councilmember Ebiner and seconded by Councilmember Badar. The motion passed unanimously. 

 
7. PLANNING 
 
 a. Introduction and first reading of Uniform Building Codes and set November 26, 2013 as date for 

public hearing and adoption. 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 1227, AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF SAN DIMAS AMENDING SPECIFIED CHAPTERS OF TITLE 15 OF THE SAN 
DIMAS MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013 
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, VOLUMES 1 & 2, THE 2013 
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF 
THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN 
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS, INCLUDING 
FEES AND PENALTIES. - FIRST READING AND INTRODUCTION 

 
Assistant City Manager of Development Services Larry Stevens announced that because of an error in 
the posted title of the ordinance, this item will be deferred to the November 26, 2013 meeting. 

 
8. SAN DIMAS HOUSING AUTHORITY 
 
 a. San Dimas Housing Authority action to appropriate $45,000 from Housing authority funds to 

supplement the city’s housing rehabilitation program for 2013-14 
 
City Manager Blaine Michaelis presented staff’s report on this item and recommended approval. 
 
MOTION:  Motion to approve was made by Councilmember Templeman, seconded by Councilmember 

Ebiner. Motion passed unanimously. 
 
9. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS 
 
 a. Members of the Audience (Speakers are limited to five (5) minutes or as may be determined by 

the Chair.) 
 
 1) Maura XX spoke on an issue her parents are having with a neighbor who is involved in the 

Humane Society’s Trap and Release Program and asked that the city consider banning it. 
 

b. City Manager 
 
 Mayor’s Call In show – November 14, 2013 
 



 
c. City Attorney 
 
 Announcement of closed session. 

 
d. Members of the City Council 

 
1) Appointment to San Gabriel Valley Mosquito & Vector Control District Board 

 
MOTION: A motion was made by Councilmember Bertone, and seconded by Mayor Morris to 
                   reappoint Councilmember Jeff Templeman. Motion passed unanimously. 

 
  2)   Councilmembers' report on meetings attended at the expense of the local agency. 
 
  Nothing to report. 
 
  3)  Individual Members' comments and updates. 
 
 Councilmember Templeman commented that there were a lot of people who came out to support the 
  HEROES’ event. 
 
The meeting adjourned at 9:12 p.m. to a closed session. The next meeting will be Tuesday, November 26, 
2013 at 7:00 p.m. 
 
10.  CLOSED SESSION  
   
 a. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(d) (4) 
 

Based on existing facts and circumstances the City Council will decide whether to initiate 
litigation regarding the medical marijuana dispensary at 146 E. Bonita Avenue 
 

ACTION: The city council directed staff to make preparations and follow through as may be 
necessary to secure a civil injunction to close a medical marijuana dispensary at 146 East 

Bonita Avenue should the facility be open any time beyond November 15, 2013. 
 
b. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54957 
 

Consideration of City Attorney change of law firm and retainer agreement with Aleshire & 
Wynder 

 
      ACTION: The city council affirmed Kenneth J. Brown to continue his service as City 

          Attorney for the city and accepted his new affiliation with the law firm of  
          Aleshire & Wynder. 

 
11. ADJOURNMENT 
 
 The closed session adjourned at 9:55 p.m. 
 

 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
__________________________________ 
Debra Black Deputy City Clerk 



 

 
 
 
 
PRESENT: 
Mayor Curtis W. Morris 
Mayor Pro Tem Denis Bertone 
Councilmember Emmett Badar 
Councilmember John Ebiner 
Councilmember Jeff Templeman  
 
City Manager Blaine Michaelis 
Assistant City Manager Ken Duran 
City Attorney Ken Brown 
Assistant City Manager for Community Development Larry Stevens 
Director of Public Works Krishna Patel 
Director of Parks and Recreation Theresa Bruns 
Capt. Don Slawson, Los Angeles County Sheriff’s Department 
 
 
CALL TO ORDER  
 
 Mayor Morris called the Special City Council Meeting to order at 5:00 p.m. 
 
1. DISCUSSSION OF POLICY/APPROACH FOR CONSIDRATION OF REQUESTS FOR 

INCREASING DENSITY ON RESIDENTIAL AND OTHER PROPERTIES 
 
 Mr. Michaelis explained that staff is experiencing more inquiries on potential increases in residential 

densities and would like a general discussion with the Council on their receptiveness on increasing 
densities.  

 
 Mr. Stevens reviewed his report and summarized that staff is seeking input from the Council on their 

level of support for the concept of increased density and not discussion on specific projects.  He 
reviewed the factors that an applicant needs to consider from his staff report. 

 
 Mayor Pro Tem Bertone asked if meeting the State RHNA numbers is the driving force in 

considering higher density.  Mr. Stevens responded that the City has adopted a strategy in the housing 
element to meet its RHNA goals in the next 8 year cycle, so the RHNA numbers obligation should 
not be a consideration. 

 
 Mr. Stevens shared two recent examples of requests for rezoning and increasing density as 

illustrations of the types of issues that are raised.  One issue that he raised was the desire to have 
applicants evaluate surrounding property for inclusion in a broader project.  There was discussion 
about the specific example in Specific Plan 23. 

 
 Councilman Templeman commented that in regards to the general question of allowing higher density 

he responds with a qualified yes, only in the right areas.  Councilman Ebiner added that he concurred 
that higher density might fit more when adjacent to retail to reduce vehicle traffic. 

 

MINUTES  
SPECIAL CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

MONDAY, OCTOBER 28, 2013                                                        
SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

CONFERENCE ROOM 
245 E. BONITA AVENUE 

 



Special City Council Minutes 
October 28, 2013                                                                                                                                           Page 2 
 
 
 Mayor Morris commented that in the Specific Plan 23 example it may not make much sense to 

include adjacent property in the project. 
 
 Mr. Stevens reviewed a second example illustrating that it may be beneficial to look at a broader area 

and consider it as a master plan.  There was discussion on the benefits and constraints of having a 
developer look at the larger project. 

 
 Mayor Pro Tem Bertone asked if increased density has a financial benefit to the City.  Mr. Michaelis 

responded that because we are a low property tax city there is not much additional property tax 
benefit.  He added that that should not be a consideration in making the land use decisions. 

 
 There was more general discussion on the topic of residential density.  Mr. Stevens summarized the 

Council discussion as them not wanting to encourage wide spread densification but supportive to 
looking at applications on a case by case basis.  He added that the Council also is supportive of staff 
encouraging applicants to look at larger projects during the pre-application process and encourages 
community discussions.  He also added that the Council expressed a desire for staff to identify project 
areas that may be candidates for increased residential density and bring a list back for Council 
consideration. 

 
 In response to a question about what is considered high density Mr. Stevens explained the varying 

levels of density categories with examples.  As an example of very high density Mr. Michaelis used 
an example of a portion of an existing commercial center development that could be changed to a 
higher density project.  He explained a reason to allow for a higher density project could be to provide 
an incentive for a developer to redevelop an underutilized property.  He explained a potential process 
to consider rezoning a site specific area with use of a development agreement.   There was further 
discussion on the concept of redeveloping existing underutilized centers.  Mr. Stevens added that 
another area that could be considered for higher density is the area around the future Gold Line 
station. 

 
2. DISCUSSION ABOUT STRUGGLING SHOPPING CENTERS REGARDING 
 APPROPRIATE CITY INTERACTIONS 
 
 Councilmember Badar asked about the opportunities to assist with the declining Via Verde shopping 

center.  Mr. Michaelis responded that staff has reached out to the property manager to offer to help 
with signage, etc., but have had no response from them.  There was discussion on the tenants at the 
center and overall deferred maintenance.   

 
 Mr. Stevens reviewed his staff report identifying three choices in dealing with struggling centers in 

general.  The first is to let the market forces let whatever happens happens.  The second is to use 
incentives or regulatory relief to help improve what’s there and the third is to consider other land uses 
for those sites.  Mayor Morris commented that he thinks the City should start thinking about what 
kinds of changes in land uses for existing centers might be acceptable.  There was discussion about 
the potentials for residential land uses for a portion of the San Dimas Station properties.  There was 
further general discussion on struggling shopping centers. 

 
 Mr. Michaelis summarized that it seems the consensus of the Council is for the City to try and 

continue to work with existing shopping center owners to offer assistance to them.  In response to a 
question regarding the status of the new Smart & Final store in the former Ralphs building, Mr. 
Stevens reported that Smart & Final has indicated that they seek changes from the design that has 
been approved.  Senior Planner Espinosa provided a general update of the concerns of the applicant.  
Councilmember Templeman expressed concern that the City is cooperating with the applicant.  Mr. 
Stevens added that staff will work closely with the applicant to get as good a design as we can. 

 



Special City Council Minutes 
October 28, 2013                                                                                                                                           Page 3 
 
 
3.   DISCUSSION REGARDING POTENTIAL CHANGES IN USES, MARKETING AND 

DISPOSITION OF FORMER REDEVELOPMENT PROPERTIES AT BONITA/CATARACT 
AND BONITA/EUCLA 

 
 Mr. Michaelis asked for Council discussion on the potential for changes in land use for the 

Bonita/Cataract property.  There was discussion regarding the current zoning for the property and 
ideas for alternative zoning.  Several Councilmembers expressed they might be open to considering a 
mixed use development for the property.  Mr. Duran explained the process for property disposition in 
the Successor Agency Long Range Property Management Plan.  Mr. Michaelis added that another 
option the City may consider is appraising the property and then for the City to consider acquiring the 
property from the Successor Agency and then have complete control over the future zoning and 
development of the property.  There was discussion on this approach and consideration for appraising 
the property to understand its value. 

 
 Mr. Duran reported that the Long Range Property Management Plan identifies that the highest and 

best use for the Bonita/Eucla property is in combination with one or more of the adjacent properties 
and it is recommended that the City pursue opportunities with those property owners.  There was 
some discussion on the prior opportunities with this property. 

 
4.  GOVERNMENT AND PUBLIC ACCESS TELEVSION DISCUSSION 
 
 Mr. Duran reviewed his staff report on the history of the City’s government access channel.  He 

added that in the past some Councilmembers have asked for discussion on adding back the public 
programming component to the channel.  Councilmember Ebiner commented that he would like to 
see the ability for public programming.  There was discussion on the pros and cons of adding the 
public programming.  The consensus of the Council was to keep it a government/education access 
channel.  

 
 Mr. Duran asked for Council feedback the benefits of the channel.  There was strong consensus that 

having the City Council meetings televised on the channel is very important.  There was discussion 
regarding some of the other programing.  There was discussion with the service quality with the 
channel and the general management of the channel.  There was discussion regarding exploring 
changes to the programming and options for the future management of the channel.  Staff was 
directed to explore possible changes to the programming on the channel and other potential 
management options.  Staff responded they will discuss with the University of La Verne a shorter 
term agreement extension while they explore options. 

 
5.  UPDATE ON THE PET FINDER PROGRAM 
 
 Mr. Duran reviewed his staff report on the history of the lost and found pet project and how it would 

operate on the City’s web site.  He added that staff is finalizing the details and will have it available to 
the public in November.  There was some concern expressed on the staff time involved in managing 
the project.  Councilman Bertone asked that the Council continue to support the project to see if it can 
be successful. 

 
6.  REPORT ON PROJECT TO ACHIEVE TECHNOLOGY IMPROVEMENTS FOR OUR 

FIELD STAFF 
 
 Mr. Michaelis reported that staff is working on technology updates on project tracking and field 

capabilities.  He added that staff has explored some options and needs some more time to refine them 
and will bring them back to the Council. 

 
 



Special City Council Minutes 
October 28, 2013                                                                                                                                           Page 4 
 
 
7.  COUNCIL COMMENTS 
 
 Councilmember Ebiner as what the next step is in the downtown revitalization.  Mr. Michaelis 

responded that the decision on the downtown boardwalk had been deferred and staff was planning on 
bringing the discussion back to the Council in the spring as part of the budget discussions.  Mr. 
Stevens added that it appears that the City will receive a SCAG grant to pay for a review of the 
downtown specific plan.  Mr. Ebiner commented that he sees much more night time activity in other 
downtowns and provided some examples of restaurants in other cities.  There was some discussion of 
the mix of businesses in the downtown and vacancy. 

 
8.  ORAL COMMUNICATIONS 
 
 None. 
 
9.  ADJOURNMENT 
 
 There being no further business Mayor Morris adjourned the meeting at 8:35 p.m. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 
 
 
 
PRESENT: 
Mayor Curtis W. Morris 
Mayor Pro Tem Denis Bertone 
Councilmember Emmett Badar 
Councilmember John Ebiner 
Councilmember Jeff Templeman  
 
City Manager Blaine Michaelis 
Assistant City Manager Ken Duran 
City Attorney Ken Brown 
Assistant City Manager for Community Development Larry Stevens 
Director of Public Works Krishna Patel 
Director of Parks and Recreation Theresa Bruns 
Lt. Clay Anderson, Los Angeles County Sheriff’s Department 
 
 
1. CALL TO ORDER  
 
Mayor Morris called the Special City Council Meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
2. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS  
 

a. Members of the Audience 
  
None. 
 
3. STUDY SESSION – Receive a report from staff – results from the 2012-13 financial audit.  Act 
on recommendations from staff regarding the allocation of undesignated fund balance. 
 
Mr. Duran reviewed his staff report on the Report on 2012-13 Fiscal Year End.  He reviewed the General 
Fund revenues for the year.  In response to a question he explained the property tax and vehicle license 
fee distribution. 
 
In response to question regarding traffic citations Lt. Anderson stated that a second patrol car has been 
dedicated as a primary traffic car.  He added that this was done to address traffic issues; however, the car 
is still available for calls for service. 
 
Mr. Duran reviewed the General Fund expenses for the year.  Mr. Duran reviewed the summary of 
Special Funds from the staff report. 
 
In response to a question Mr. Michaelis explained the loan repayments to the City and Walker House 
LLC from the former Redevelopment Agency for the Walker House renovation project and clarified that 
there is no outstanding City debt obligation for the project.  Also in response to a question Mr. Michaelis 
explained that the bond obligation payment for the City Hall renovation is paid for as a General Fund 
expense and does not come from reserves. 

MINUTES  
SPECIAL CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

TUESDAY, OCTOBER 22, 2013, 5:30 P. M.                                                        
SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

CONFERENCE ROOM 
245 E. BONITA AVENUE 

 



Special City Council Minutes 
October 22, 2013                                                                                                                                           Page 2 
 
 
In response to a question Mr. Patel explained the types of potential sewer projects are in the Sewer Fund. 
 
Mr. Duran explained that the revenue from the voter approved parcel tax in the Landscape Parcel Tax 
Fund is not enough to pay for city wide landscape maintenance, with more and more general fund support 
required each year. 
 
Mr. Duran explained the development fee allocation for the various Park Development Funds.  He added 
that there will be a large infusion of fees from the Bonita Canyon Gateway project that could be used for 
Marchant Park improvements.  Councilman Templeman suggested that if revenue is anticipated that 
maybe the Council should allocate money to begin the design portion of the restrooms.  There was 
discussion on how to approach the decision on future improvements to Marchant Park. 
 
In response to a question Mr. Michaelis explained the loan repayment arrangement to the General Fund 
from the Golf Course Fund for the Golf Course loans. 
 
Mayor Pro Tem Bertone clarified that according to the All Funds Summary the total fund balance is $26.8 
million.  Mr. Duran confirmed that as accurate but also clarified that $14.9 million of that is for the 
General Fund. 
 
Mr. Michaelis made a presentation regarding the beginning General Fund balance of $13.9 million being 
78% of general fund expenses.  He suggested that the Council consider maintaining a General Fund 
balance of 78% which would then allow $1,056,000 available for distribution to other Funds.  He further 
suggested that the distribution be $856,305 to Fund 12, the Infrastructure Fund; and $200,000 to Fund 70, 
the Infrastructure Fund.  He added that the Council hold off any distributions to Fund 20, Park 
Development at this time and monitor anticipated development fees rather than make an allocation now.  
There was discussion on the proposed General Fund reserve strategy and recommended distributions. 
 
Mayor Pro Tem Bertone asked if funds are being set aside for the MS4 permit expenses.  Mr. Michaelis 
responded that all of the current years anticipated expenses, mostly for planning, are included in the 
General Fund.  Future expenses will have to be considered once those amounts are known. 
 
Mayor Pro Tem Bertone asked about restoring some of the programs eliminated last year such as Project 
Sister.  Mayor Morris suggested the Council consider restoring programs as a part of the budget process 
for next year. 
 
Mr. Michaelis reviewed the recent historic General Fund balance summary.  There was further discussion 
on the reserve fund balance.  Councilman Badar made a motion to maintain the 78% General Fund fund 
balance and allocate $856,305 to Fund 12 and $200,000 to Fund 70.  The motion was approved 
unanimously. 
 
There was discussion on restroom and other improvements to Marchant Park.  Staff was directed to begin 
to consider a plan to review future improvements to Marchant Park and bring back ideas to the Council. 
 
There being no further business the meeting was adjourned at 6:50 p.m. 
 
 
4.  ADJOURNMENT 
 
The Study Session adjourned at 6:55 p.m. 
 
 
 
 



Special City Council Minutes 
October 22, 2013                                                                                                                                           Page 3 
 
 
 
 



 
ORDINANCE NO. 1226 

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN 
DIMAS ADOPTING MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT AMENDMENT 13-05, 
AMENDING CHAPTERS 18.08, 18.16, AND 18.20 OF THE SAN 
DIMAS MUNICIPAL ZONING CODE   

 
 
 THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS DOES ORDAIN AS 
FOLLOWS: 
 
 SECTION 1.  Title 18, Chapters 8, 16, and 20 of the San Dimas 
Municipal Code shall be amended, as provided for in Exhibit “A”  
 
 SECTION 2.  This Ordinance shall take effect 30 days after its final 
passage, and within 15 days after its passage the City Clerk shall cause it to be 
published in the Inland Valley Daily Bulletin, a newspaper of general circulation in 
the City of San Dimas hereby designated for that purpose. 
 
 PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED THIS 26th DAY OF November, 
2013. 
 
 

        
  ___________________________________ 

     Curt Morris, Mayor of the City of San Dimas 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
___________________________ 
Debra Black, Deputy City Clerk 
 
 
 I, DEBRA BLACK, DEPUTY CITY CLERK of the City of San Dimas, do 
hereby certify that Ordinance No. 1226 was regularly introduced at the regular 
meeting of the City Council on November 12, 2013, and was thereafter adopted 
and passed at the regular meeting of the City Council held on  
November 26th, 2013 by the following vote: 
 
 AYES:  Badar, Bertone, Ebiner, Templeman, Morris   
 NOES: None   
 ABSENT: None  
 ABSTAIN: None  

4c



ORDINANCE NO. 1226  Page 2 of 5 
     
 
 I DO FURTHER CERTIFY that within 15 days of the date of its passage, I 
caused a copy of Ordinance 1226 to be published in the Inland Valley Daily 
Bulletin. 
 
 
       
________________________________ 
Debra Black, Deputy City Clerk 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 1226  Page 3 of 5 
     
 

EXHIBIT A 
 

*New text changes are in Blue and Underlined 
*Deleted text is in Red and Strikethrough 

 

Definitions Section- Chapter 18.08 
 
18.08.307 Household chickens. 
 
“Household chickens” mean chickens maintained on the premise of a legally 
constructed single-family residential property as an incidental use of the property 
for pets or for egg-laying purposes only (no slaughter) for the sole use of the 
residents of the property (no selling or distribution of eggs). This definition 
expressly excludes roosters, ducks, geese, turkeys, peacocks and other similar 
noise-making fowl. 

 

Zoning Districts, Maps, and Boundaries- 18.16.040 

18.16.040 Zoning of certain classifications of annexed territory. 
Notwithstanding the provisions of Section 18.16.030, all land or territory annexed to 
the city after the effective date of the amendment codified in this section which is 
classified under the zoning ordinance of the county with a minimum area 
requirement of one acre or more may be used for those purposes permitted under 
the zone classification R-A-20,000 under the city zoning ordinance, and the zoning 
map shall be amended so as to indicate such land or territory as having such zoning 
designation.  

(Ord. 61 § 1, 1962: Ord. 37 § 310, 1961) 

 

Residential Zones Generally- Chapter 18.20 
18.20.010 Applicability. 
As used in this chapter, “residential zones” means zones SF, SFA, SFDR, SFH,  
AL, MFD, MF-10, MF-15, MF-20 and those specific plans which permit or 
conditionally permit residential uses.  

(Ord. 931 § 3, 1990: Ord. 37 § 201, 1961) 
 
 
 
 
 

http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=18-18_16-18_16_040&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=18-18_20-18_20_010&frames=on


ORDINANCE NO. 1226  Page 4 of 5 
     
 
18.20.055 Roosters. 
 
A person shall not keep or maintain any live rooster or rooster of any age in any 
residential zone, whether such rooster is kept or maintained for the personal use 
of the occupant or otherwise. 
 
18.20.060 Animals.  
A. Household pets may be kept in residential zones under the following conditions; 

1. Such pets shall not be kept in such number or under such conditions that 
create a neighborhood nuisance from noise, odors, dust or appearance. 

2. Not more than three adult dogs or cats or three similar domestic animals 
or three animals of any combination of the above may be kept. 

3. Not more than three small animals, such as guinea pigs, rabbits or white 
mice may be kept. 

4. Not more than fifteen birds or fowl shall be kept, none of which shall be 
chickens roosters, ducks, geese, turkeys, peacocks, or household chickens. 

5. No venomous animals nor any animal that cannot be or is not actually 
prevented from invading or becoming a nuisance to neighboring premises 
may be kept. 

B. In addition to other permitted animal uses in the respective zone, household 
chickens may be kept as an accessory use to a legally-established detached, 
single-family residence on a lot size of no less than 5,000 square feet in zones 
which permit single-family residential uses under the following conditions: 

1. Not more than three chickens may be kept.   

2. Such chickens shall not be kept under such conditions that create a 
neighborhood nuisance from noise, odors, dust, or appearance. 

3. An appropriate coop enclosure shall be provided. Said coop shall not 
exceed six (6) feet in height or 120 square feet in area and shall comply 
with the setback requirements for accessory structures in their respective 
zone. The coop shall provide a minimum of 4 square feet of space per 
chicken and may not be located in front of the main building line. Chickens 
shall be kept in their coops from dusk until dawn. When allowed outside 
their coops, household chickens shall be kept within adequate fences no 
greater than six (6) feet in height so that they do not have access to 
neighboring property.  

4. Feed for such animals shall be stored in rodent proof containers and 
feeders. 



ORDINANCE NO. 1226  Page 5 of 5 
     
 
B. Provided further, however, in R-A zones in parcels of eleven thousand square 
feet or larger with a minimum width of eighty feet and containing not more than 
one dwelling unit, domestic animals in addition to the household pets as limited in 
subsection (A) of this section shall be permitted within the following limitations, and 
solely for the use of the family residing on the parcel: 

 1. Rabbits, not to exceed one buck and four does; 

 2. Fowl for meat purposes, not to exceed twenty-five; 

 3. Chickens for eggs, not to exceed twenty layers; 

 4. Calves, not to exceed one calf under two years of age, and none older; 

 5. Goats, not to exceed two milk goats and one young goat. 

C. All animals shall be properly housed at a distance of not less than thirty-five feet 
from any residence, with the exception of household pets and household chickens, 
whose houses must comply with the setback standards of their respective zones. 
If allowed outside their houses, animals shall be kept within adequate fences so 
that they do not have access to neighboring property.  

 (Ord. 368 § 1, 1972; Ord. 120 § 2, 1964; Ord. 37 § 206, 1961) 

 

 

 

 
 



 

 
 

 

Agenda Item Staff Report 

 

To: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council 
 For the meeting of November 26, 2013 
 
From: Blaine Michaelis, City Manager 
 
Initiated by: Eric M. Beilstein, Superintendent of Building & Safety 
 

Subject: Ordinance 1227 - AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL 

OF THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS AMENDING SPECIFIED 

CHAPTERS OF TITLE 15 OF THE SAN DIMAS MUNICIPAL 

CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 1997 

UNIFORM ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, THE 2013 EDITION 

OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, VOLUMES 1 & 2, 

THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL 

CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 

PLUMBING CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE 

CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF 

THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2013 

EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, AND THE 2013 

EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING 

STANDARDS CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN 

AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND 

EXCEPTIONS, INCLUDING FEES AND PENALTIES 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

SUMMARY 
 

Amend Title 15 of the San Dimas Municipal Code (Buildings and 
Construction) by adopting by reference the 2013 Editions of the 
California Model Codes to regulate the construction, alteration, 
and occupancy of all buildings or structures in the City of San 
Dimas and be consistent with the California Health and Safety 
Code.  

5a



 

BACKGROUND: The California Health and Safety Code establishes a Building 

Standards Commission, whose duties include approval, codification, and 

publication of building standards in a triennial edition of the California Building 

Standards Code, commonly called Title 24 and also establishes a date that these 

codes become effective throughout the State. The effective date for this triennial 

edition is January 1, 2014. 

The adoption of these codes would regulate the fabrication, construction, 

enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, 

occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, or other improvements to real property; 

maintenance of all buildings or structures in the City of San Dimas; and provision 

for issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore. 

The Building Standards Code does not include the adoption of procedural 

ordinances by a City or other agency related to civil, administrative, or criminal 

procedures and remedies available for enforcing code violations. 

 
 

 
RECOMMENDATION:  
 
Set for Public Hearing Ordinance 1227 to adopt by reference the 2013 editions of the 
California model codes with various additions, deletions and additional administrative 
provisions. 
 
Eric M. Beilstein 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 1227 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS AMENDING SPECIFIED 
CHAPTERS OF TITLE 15 OF THE SAN DIMAS 
MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING BY 
REFERENCE THE 1997 UNIFORM ADMINISTRATIVE 
CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
BUILDING CODE, VOLUMES 1 & 2, THE 2013 
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL 
CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
PLUMBING CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2013 
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL 
CODE, THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
FIRE CODE, AND THE 2013 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS 
CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS, 
ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS, 
INCLUDING FEES AND PENALTIES 

WHEREAS, the California Health and Safety Code establishes a Building 
Standards Commission, whose duties include approval, codification, and 
publication of building standards in a triennial edition of the California Building 
Standards Code, commonly called Title 24; and 

WHEREAS, the Building Standards Commission also establishes a date 
that these codes become effective throughout the State; and 

WHEREAS, the effective date for this triennial edition is January 1, 2014; 
and 

WHEREAS, the adoption of these codes would regulate the fabrication, 
construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, 
conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, or other improvements to 
real property; maintenance of all buildings or structures in the City of San Dimas; 
and provision for issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and 

WHEREAS, the Building Standards Code does not include the adoption of 
procedural ordinances by a City or other agency related to civil, administrative, or 
criminal procedures and remedies available for enforcing code violations. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN 
DIMAS DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

All references to a prior code shall mean to apply to the corresponding 
provisions of the newly adopted code. 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 2 of 14 

 

Section 15.02.010 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby repealed and 
replaced in its entirety as follows: 

 15.02.010 Uniform Administrative Code 

 Except as otherwise amended in this chapter, the 1997 Edition of the 
Uniform Administrative Code, as prepared by the International Conference 
of Building Officials, is adopted as the San Dimas Administrative Code 
and may be cited as such.  

15.02.020 Amendments.  

 The following amendments are made to the San Dimas administrative 
code: 

 Section 103, Definitions,  All references to a specific code shall be 
deemed to refer to the lastest adopted San Dimas codes and standards. 

 Section 204.1, General, is amended to read as follows: 

 “In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or 
determinations made by the Building Official relative to the application 
and interpretation of the technical code, there shall be and is hereby 
created a board of appeals consisting of the members of the 
Development Plan Review Board. The building official shall be an ex 
officio member and shall act as secretary to said board but shall have 
no vote upon any matter before the board. The Board of Appeals shall 
be appointed by the governing body and shall hold office at its 
pleasure. The board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its 
business an shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the 
appellant with a duplicate copy to the building official.” 

 Section 205, Violations, is amended to read as follows: 

 “No person, firm or corporation, whether as owner, lessee, sublessee 
or occupant, shall erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, 
improve, remove, demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any 
building or premises, or cause or permit the same to be done contrary 
to or in violation of any of the provisions of said code or any order 
issued by the board of appeals or building official thereunder. Any 
person violating the provisions of this section is guilty of a 
misdemeanor or an infraction for each day such violation continues.” 

  Section 301.2.1 is amended by deleting subsection (10) window awnings. 

 Section 303 is amended by adding subsection 303.6 to read as follows: 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 3 of 14 

 “No building permit may be issued for any development unless the 
proposed construction is consistent with the GENERAL PLAN OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS.” 

  Section 304.2, Permit Fees, is amended to read as follows: 

 “Building permit fees shall be paid in the amount fixed from time to time 
by the City Council by resolution. The determination of value or 
valuation under any of the provisions of this code shall be made by the 
building official. The value to be used in computing the building permit 
and plan review fees shall be the total value of all construction work for 
which the permit is issued as well as all finish work, painting, roofing, 
electrical, plumbing, heating, air-conditioning, elevators, fire 
extinguishing systems and any other permanent equipment.” 

 Section 304.3, Plan Review Fees, is amended to read as follows: 

 “When a plan or other data are required to be submitted by Subsection 
(b) of Section 302, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of 
submitting plans and specifications for review. The plan review fee 
shall be in the amount fixed from time to time by the City Council by 
resolution. When plans are incomplete or changed so as to require 
additional plan review, an additional plan review fee shall be paid.” 

 Section 304.5.2, Fee is hereby amended to read: 

“An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected 
whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The 
investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit fee 
required. The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt the 
applicant from compliance with all other provisions of either this code 
or the technical codes nor from the penalty prescribed by law”. 

 Chapter 3, Fee Tables 3-A through 3-H are hereby deleted. 

Section 15.04.010 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby repealed and 
replaced in its entirety as follows: 

15.04.010   Adoption. 
Except as provided in this Chapter, those certain building codes known 
and designated as the California Building Code, 2013 Edition, Volumes 1 
and 2, including Appendix Chapters "C," Agricultural Buildings 
"F,"Rodentproofing "I," Patio Covers and "J," Grading based on the 2012 
International Building Code as published by the International Code 
Council, shall be and become the Building Codes of the City of San Dimas 
for regulating the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, 
replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, 
maintenance, removal and demolition of every buildings and/or structures 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 4 of 14 

or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or 
structures throughout the City.  The California Building Code and its 
appendix chapters will be on file for public examination in the office of the 
Building Official. 

Section 15.04.020 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby amended as 
follows: 

15.04.020   Amendments and additions 
The following section of the California Building Code (CBC) Chapter 1, 
"Scope and Administration, Division I, California Administration," is 
amended as follows: 
 
1.8.8 Appeals Board.  Subsection 1.8.8 is hereby deleted in its entirety. 

 
The following portions and sections of "Chapter 1, Scope and 
Administration, Division II, Scope and Administration" are hereby 
amended as follows: 

 
The following language shall be added to Subsection 101.2 
"Scope": 
 
In order to properly maintain and safeguard healthful living 
conditions and comply with all provisions of the Building Codes, it is 
hereby declared unlawful to use any streetcars, boxcars, house 
cars, motor bus bodies, or similar means of conveyance or 
structures of similar nature of construction, for places of habitation, 
residence, or place of business in this City.  However, nothing 
contained herein shall prohibit the use of any house trailer or 
mobile home for places of abode or habitation in an approved 
mobile home park, providing such structures comply with all other 
conditions and requirements of this Code. 

 
The following language shall be added to Subsection 102.1 
"General": 

 
If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, 
clause, or phrase of this Code or any part thereof is in conflict with 
the Fire Code, the most restrictive shall be applicable. 

 
Subsection 105.2 "Work exempt from permit" is hereby amended as 
follows:  

 
Item 02 (Fences) under "Building" is hereby amended to read 
“Fences not over 6 feet high”. 

 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 5 of 14 

Item 04 (Retaining walls) under “Building” is hereby amended to 
read “ Retaining walls 
 
Item 10 (Shade cloth structures) under "Building" is hereby deleted 
in its entirety. 
 
Item 12 (Window awnings) under "Building" is hereby deleted in its 
entirety. 

 
Subsection 105.3.2 "Time limitation of application" is hereby adopted and 
amended to read as follows: 
 

Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days following 
the date of application shall expire by limitation.  Plans and other 
data submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the 
applicant or destroyed by the Building Official.  The Building Official 
may extend the time for action by the applicant for a period not 
exceeding 180 days on written request by the applicant showing 
the circumstances beyond the control of the applicant having 
prevented action from being taken.  An application shall not be 
extended more than once.  An application shall not be extended if 
this Code or any other pertinent laws or ordinances have been 
amended subsequent to the date of application.  In order to renew 
action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall 
resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee.  All plans submitted 
for review prior to the effective date of this Ordinance shall expire 
by limitation within 180 days of application with no extensions. 

 
Subsection 105.5 "Expiration" is hereby adopted and amended to read as 
follows: 

 
Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of 
the technical codes shall expire by limitation and become null and 
void, if the building or work authorized by such permit is not 
commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit, or if the 
building or work authorized by such permit is suspended or 
abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for a period of 
180 days.  Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit 
shall be first obtained to do so, and the fee therefore shall be one-
half the amount required for a new permit for such work, provided 
no changes have been made or will be made in the original plans 
and specifications for such work, and provided further, that such 
suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year.  In order 
to renew action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay 
a new full permit fee. 

 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 6 of 14 

A permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension 
of the time within which work may commence under that permit 
when the permittee is unable to commence work within the time 
required by this Section for good and satisfactory reasons.  The 
Building Official may extend the time for action by the permittee for 
a period not exceeding 180 days upon written request by the 
permittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the 
permittee have prevented action from being taken.  Permits shall 
not be extended more than once. 

 
Subsection 105.5.1 "Expiration of demolition permit” is hereby adopted 
and amended to read as follows: 

 
A demolition permit shall expire by limitation and become null-and-
void 60 days after the date on which the permit was issued. The 
Building Official may extend the validity of the permit for a period 
not exceeding 180 days beyond the initial 60 day limit upon written 
request by the applicant filed with the Building Official prior to the 
expiration date of the original permit. 

 
Subsection 105.5.2 "Expiration of permit for legalizing unpermitted 
structures” is hereby adopted and amended to read as follows: 

 
Notwithstanding any provision of Section 105.5, if a building permit 
was issued in order to bring an unpermitted structure or other 
unlawful, substandard, or hazardous condition into compliance with 
any applicable law, ordinance, rule or regulation, such permit shall 
expire by limitation and become null-and-void 90 days after the 
date on which the permit was issued. The Building Official may 
extend the validity of the permit for a period not exceeding 90 days 
beyond the initial 90 day limit upon written request filed with the 
Building Official prior to the expiration date of the original permit. 

 
Subsection 107.5 "Retention of construction documents" is hereby 
amended by adding the following language: 
 

Before final inspection, electronic images of all plans, engineering 
calculations, and records that are submitted for the purpose of 
obtaining a building permit shall be submitted at the request of the 
Building Official.  Electronic images shall be based on the Building 
Division's Electronic Archiving Policy.  

 
Section 109 "Fees" is hereby adopted and amended as follows: 
 

Subsection 109.2 "Schedule of permit fees" is hereby amended by 
adding the following language: 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 7 of 14 

 
When submittal documents are required by Section 302.2 of the 
Uniform Administrative Code, a plan review fee shall be paid at the 
time of submitting the submittal documents for plan review.  The 
plan review fee shall be 100 percent of the building, electrical, 
mechanical and plumbing work permit fee as required in 
accordance with the fee schedule established by resolution of the 
City Council.  When the City retains a private entity or person to 
perform plan review, the plan review fee shall be in an amount 
sufficient to defray the cost of such services, but in no case shall 
the plan review fee be less than the amount specified in this 
Section. 

 
Subsection 109.4 "Work commencing before permit issuance" is hereby 
deleted and replaced in its entirety as follows: 

 
109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance.  Whenever 
work for which a permit is required by this Code has been 
commenced without first obtaining a permit, a special investigation 
shall be made before a permit may be issued for such work.  An 
investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected 
whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued.  The 
investigation fee shall be as required, as in accordance with the 
schedule as established by the applicable governing authority.  The 
minimum investigation fee shall be the same as the minimum fee 
set forth in accordance with the schedule as established by the 
applicable governing authority (double fee).  The payment of such 
investigation fee shall not exempt an applicant from compliance 
with all other provisions of either this Code or the technical codes 
nor from the penalty prescribed by law.   

 
Subsection 109.6 "Refunds" is hereby deleted and replaced in its entirety 
as follows: 
 

109.6  Refunds.  The Building Official may authorize up to 100 % 
refunding of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or 
collected.  The Building Official may authorize refunding of not 
more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has 
been done under a permit issued in accordance with this Code.  
The Building Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 
percent of plan review fee has been paid when an application for a 
permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or 
cancelled before any examination time has been expanded.  The 
Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid 
except upon written request filed by the original permittee not later 
than 180 days after the date of payment. 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 8 of 14 

 
Section 110 "Inspections" is adopted and amended by adding the 
following subsection: 
 

110.1.1  Workmanship.  It is the intention of the City that all 
construction carried on under the review of the Building Division is 
of good quality.  The Building Official shall be empowered to 
enforce the installation of work that is straight, level, plumb, square, 
etc., as the situation requires.  All work shall be well fit and of a 
durable nature.  Paint in all cases shall not be below normal 
standard for the use applied. The proper grading of walks, drives, 
and yards shall be required when being installed with the work 
requiring a building permit.  A minimum thickness of 3½ inches for 
flat concrete work and 2 inches for asphalt paving shall be required.  
All exterior flat concrete work shall include such breaks for 
expansion as deemed necessary by the Building Official. 

 
Subsection 110.3.5 "Lath and gypsum board inspection" is hereby 
amended by deleting the "exception" in its entirety. 

 
Subsection 110.3.8 "Other inspections" is hereby amended by adding the 
following language:  
 

A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or 
reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is 
called is not complete or when corrections called for are not made.  
This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees 
the first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with the 
requirements of the technical codes but as controlling the practice 
of calling for inspections before the job is ready for such inspection 
or reinspection.  To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an 
application therefore in writing upon a form furnished for that 
purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with a fee 
schedule adopted by this jurisdiction.  In instances where 
reinspection fees have been assessed, additional inspection of the 
work will not be performed until the required fees have been paid. 

 
Subsection 110.5 "Inspection requests" is hereby deleted and replaced in 
its entirety as follows:  
 

110.5  Inspection requests.  It shall be the duty of the person 
doing the work authorized by the permit to notify the Building 
Official that such work is ready for inspection.  The Building Official 
may require that every request for inspection be filed at least one 
working day before such inspection is desired.  Such request may 
be requested in writing or by telephone at the option of the Building 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 9 of 14 

Official.  It shall be the duty of the person requesting any 
inspections required by either this Code or the technical codes to 
provide access to and means for inspection of the work. 

 
Section 111 "Certificate of Occupancy" is hereby adopted and amended 
by adding the following subsection:  

 
111.5  Utility release.  The following minimum requirements shall 
be completed prior to any occupancy or utilities connected: 

  
(1)  Written clearance from the Fire and Public Works Departments 
and Planning and Business License Divisions. 

 
(2) The following when applicable: 

 
(a)  Electronic imaging of plans received (if required). 
 
(b)  Verification of school fees paid. 

 
(c)  Grading certificate received. 

 
(d)  All plan review fees paid. 

 
(e)  Sewer assessment fees paid. 
 
(f)  Hazard materials statements received. 

 
(g)  Subcontractor's list received. 

 
The following sections of the California Building Code (CBC), are amended as 
follows: 
 
Section 3109.4.1 Barrier height and clearances is amended to read as 
follows: 
 

The top of the barrier shall be at least 60 inches above grade measured 
on the side of the barrier that faces away from the swimming pool. The 
maximum vertical clearance between grade and the bottom of the barrier 
shall be 2 inches measured on the side of the barrier that faces away from 
the swimming pool. Where the top of the pool structures is above grade, 
the barrier is authorized to be at ground level or mounted on top of the 
pool structure, and the maximum vertical clearance between the top of the 
pool structure and the bottom of the barrier shall be 4 inches. 

 
Appendix I Section I104.2 Footings is eliminated in its entirety. 
 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 10 of 14 

 
Appendix J Section J103.2 Exception (1) is amended to read: 
 

Grading in an isolated, self-contained area, provided there is no 
danger to the public, that such grading will not adversely affect adjoining 
properties, and is less than a total of fifty (50) cubic yards (cut and fill). 

 
Section Jll0 Erosion Control is hereby amended by adding: 

 
J 110.3 Stormwater Management and Discharge. All construction 
sites are subject to the latest requirements of the City of San Dimas 
enforced 
National Pollution Discharge Elimination System (NPDES), Best 
Management 
Practices (BMPs), and applicable pollution control and erosion protection 
measures pursuant to Chapter 14.11 of the San Dimas Municipal Code. 

Section 15.44.010 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby repealed and 
replaced in its entirety as follows: 

15.44.010 Adoption. 
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Electrical Code, 2013 
Edition, based on the 2012 National Electrical Code as published by the 
National Fire Protection Association, shall be and become the Electrical 
Code of the City of San Dimas, regulating all installation, arrangement, 
alteration, repair, use, and other operation of electrical wiring, 
connections, fixtures, and other electrical appliances on premises within 
the City.  The California Electrical Code is on file for public examination in 
the office of the Building Official. 

Chapter 15.46 is hereby added to Title 10 ("Buildings and Construction") of the 
San Dimas Municipal Code to read as follows: 

Chapter 15.46 
GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE 

Sections: 
15.46.010  Adoption. 
15.46.020 Green Building Standards Code amendments. 

15.46.010 Adoption. 
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Green Standards Code, 2013 
Edition as published by the California Building Standards Commission, shall be 
and become the Green Building Standards Code of the City, regulating and 
controlling the planning, design, operation, use and occupancy of every newly 
constructed building or structure in the City.  The California Green Building 
Standards Code shall be on file for public examination in the office of the Building 
Official. 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 11 of 14 

15.46.020 Green Building Standards Code amendments. 
The 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code is hereby 
adopted with no amendments. 

 
Sections 15.28.010 and 15.28.020 of the San Dimas Municipal Code are hereby 
repealed and replaced in their entirety as follows: 

15.28.010   Adoption. 
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Mechanical Code, 2013 
Edition, based on the 2012 Uniform Mechanical Code as published by the 
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO), 
shall be and become the Mechanical Code of the City, regulating and 
controlling the design, construction, installation, quality of materials, 
location, operation, and maintenance of heating, ventilating, cooling, 
refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other miscellaneous heat-
producing appliances.  The California Mechanical Code is on file for public 
examination in the office of the Building Official. 

15.28.020   Mechanical Code amendments. 
The 2013 Edition of the California Mechanical Code is hereby adopted 
with no amendments. 

Sections 15.48.010 and 15.48.020 of the San Dimas Municipal Code are hereby 
repealed and replaced in their entirety as follows: 

15.48.010 Adoption. 
Except as provided in this chapter, the California Plumbing Code, 2013 
Edition, based on the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code as published by the 
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO), 
shall be and become the Plumbing Code of the City of San Dimas, 
regulating erection, installation, alteration, repair, relocation, replacement, 
maintenance, or use of plumbing systems within the City.  The California 
Plumbing Code will be on file for public examination in the office of the 
Building Official. 

15.48.020 Plumbing Code amendments. 
The 2010 Edition of the California Plumbing Code is adopted with no 
amendments.  

Chapter 10.50 is hereby added to Title 15 ("Buildings and Construction") of the 
San Dimas Municipal Code to read as follows: 

 

 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 12 of 14 

Chapter 15.50 
RESIDENTIAL CODE 

Sections: 
15.50.010  Adoption. 
15.50.020 Residential Code amendments. 
 

15.50.010 Adoption. 
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Residential Code, 2013 Edition, 
based on the 2012 International Residential Code, as published by the California 
Building Standards Commission, shall be and become the Residential Building 
Code of the City, regulating construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, 
replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, 
removal and demolition of every detached one- and two-family dwelling and 
townhouse not more than three stories above grade in height with a separate 
means of egress and structures accessory thereto in the City.  The California 
Residential Code will be on file for public examination in the office of the Building 
Official. 

10.50.020 Residential Code amendments. 
The following portions and sections of Chapter 1, Scope and Application, Division 
I "California Administration," and Division II "Administration" are hereby amended 
as follows: 

1.8.4.1 Permits                                                                    Exception 
2 is hereby deleted in its entirety. 

1.8.8 Appeals Board.  Section 1.8.8 is hereby deleted in its entirety. 

1.8.9 Unsafe Buildings or Structures.  Section 1.8.9 is hereby deleted in 
its entirety. 

Section R105 "Permits" is hereby amended as follows: 

Item 9 (fences) under "Building" is hereby amended to read “Fences not 
over 6 feet high”. 

Item 9 (window awnings) under "Building" is hereby deleted in its entirety. 

Section R109 "Inspection" is hereby adopted and amended by adding the 
following subsection: 

R109.0.1 Workmanship.  It is the intention of the City that all construction 
carried on under the review of the Building Division is of good quality.  The 
Building Official shall be empowered to enforce the installation of work that 
is straight, level, plumb, square, etc., as the situation requires.  All work 
shall be well fit and of a durable nature.  Paint in all cases shall not be 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 13 of 14 

below normal standard for the use applied.  The proper grading of walks, 
drives, and yards shall be required when being installed with the work 
requiring a building permit.  A minimum thickness of 3½ inches for flat 
concrete work and 2 inches for asphalt paving shall be required.  All 
exterior flat concrete work shall include such breaks for expansion as 
deemed necessary by the Building Official. 
 

Subsection R109.1.5 "Other inspections" is hereby amended by adding the 
following language:  

A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection 
when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or 
when corrections called for are not made.  This section is not to be 
interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for 
failure to comply with the requirements of the technical codes but as 
controlling the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for 
such inspection or reinspection.  To obtain a reinspection, the applicant 
shall file an application therefore in writing upon a form furnished for that 
purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with a fee schedule 
adopted by this jurisdiction.  In instances where reinspection fees have 
been assessed, additional inspection of the work will not be performed 
until the required fees have been paid. 

Chapter 10.51 is hereby added to Title 15 ("Buildings and Construction") of the 
San Dimas Municipal Code to read as follows: 

 

Chapter 15.51 
FIRE CODE 

Sections: 

15.51.010 Adoption. 
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Fire Code, 2013 Edition, 
based on the 2012 International Fire Code, as published by the California 
Building Standards Commission, shall be and become the Fire Code of the 
City, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire 
and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling, and use of 
hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions 
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in 
the City. The California Fire Code will be on file for public examination in the 
office of the Building Official. 

 
 Severability. 

If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause, or 
phrase of this Ordinance or any part thereof is for any reason held to be 



Ordinance 1227 

  Page 14 of 14 

unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining 
portion of this Ordinance or any part thereof.  The City Council hereby 
declares that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, 
paragraph, sentence, clause, or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that 
any one or more sections, subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, 
sentences, clauses, or phrases be declared unconstitutional. 

 Effective Date. 

This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect thirty (30) days after 
passage. 

 Posting. 

The City Clerk shall certify to the passage of this Ordinance and cause the 
same to be posted pursuant to Government Code Section 36933. 

 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED this XX day of XX, 2013. 

   
                                                                  Curtis W. Morris, Mayor City of San Dimas 
  

ATTEST: 

   
                                                                 Debra Black, Deputy City Clerk 

I, Debra Black, Deputy City Clerk of the City of San Dimas, DO HEREBY 
CERTIFY that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Ordinance No. 1227 of 
said City, which was introduced at a regular meeting of the City Council held on 
the 26th day of November, 2013, and finally passed not less than five (5) days 
thereafter on the XX day of XX, 2013, by the following vote: 

AYES:  
NOES:  
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:  

   
                                                                 Debra Black, Deputy City Clerk 



6a





















6b














	November 26, 2013 Agenda
	4a. November Warrant Register
	4b. November 12, 2013 Minutes
	October 28, 2013 Retreat Minutes
	October 22, 2013 Study Session Minutes
	4c. Ordinance No 1226 MCTA 13-05
	5a. Uniform Building Codes
	6a. Extension Agreement ULV
	6b. Waste Management



