
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
CITY COUNCIL: 
Mayor Curtis W. Morris 
Mayor Pro Emmett Badar  
Councilmember Denis Bertone 
Councilmember John Ebiner 
Councilmember Jeff Templeman 
 
1. CALL TO ORDER AND FLAG SALUTE 
 
2. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS (Members of the audience are invited to address the City Council on 

any item not on the agenda.  Under the provisions of the Brown Act, the legislative body is prohibited 
from taking or engaging in discussion on any item not appearing on the posted agenda.  However, 
your concerns may be referred to staff or set for discussion at a later date.  If you desire to address the 
City Council on an item on this agenda, other than a scheduled public hearing item you may do so at 
this time or asked to be heard when that agenda item is considered.  Comments on public hearing 
items will be considered when that item is scheduled for discussion.  The Public Comment period is 
limited to 30 minutes.  Each speaker shall be limited to three (3) minutes.) 

 
a. Members of the Audience 

 
3. CONSENT CALENDAR 

 (All items on the Consent Calendar are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one motion 
unless a member of the City Council requests separate discussion.) 
 
a. Resolutions read by title, further reading waived, passage and adoption recommended as follows: 

 
RESOLUTION 2016-58, A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, APPROVING CERTAIN DEMANDS FOR THE MONTHS 
OF NOVEMBER AND DECEMBER, 2016. 
 

b. Approval of minutes from the November 22nd, Study Session and City Council meetings. 
 

c. A Request for the City Council to Reject Low Bidder, Principles Contracting, Inc., and 
Award Construction Contract 2016-03, Via Verde Park Improvement Project, to Micon 
Construction, Inc. in the amount of $439,735 and allocate a total project budget of 
$565,771. 

 
d. Approval of Administrative Services Agreement between the City of San Dimas and the 

Housing Authority 
 

END OF CONSENT CALENDAR 
 
 

                         SAN DIMAS CITY COUNCIL  
CITY OF SAN DIMAS SUCESSOR AGENCY 
SAN DIMAS HOUSING AUTHORITY  

SAN DIMAS PUBLIC FACILITIES  
FINANCING CORPORATION AGENDA 

TUESDAY, DECEMBER 13, 2016, 7:00 P. M. 
SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

245 E. BONITA AVE. 



City Council Agenda 
December 13, 2016                                                                                                                                            Page 2 
 
4. PUBLIC HEARING 
 

a. MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT AMENDMENT 16-01 – A request to update Municipal Code 
Section 18.38 Second Dwelling Units in response to SB1089 and AB2299, including revisions to 
parking and other standards, City-wide.  The Planning Commission voted 5-0 to recommend 
approval at their regular meeting of November 17, 2016. 

 
 ORDINANCE 1251, AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF  
 SAN   DIMAS, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, ADOPTING MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT 
 AMENDMENT 16-01, A REQUEST TO REVISE CHAPTER 18.38 (SECOND UNITS)  
 TO BE CONSISTENT WITH STATE LAW CHANGES REGARDING ACCESSORY 
 DWELLING UNITS (ADUs) (FIRST READING AND INTRODUCTION) 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Waive full reading and introduce Ordinance 1251. 

 
5. OTHER MATTERS 
 
 a. Cast vote for Councilmember Margaret Clark to represent the city on the San Gabriel 

Valley Basin Water Quality Control Board 
 

RESOLUTION 2016-59 A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF  
THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, CASTING ITS VOTE(S) FOR 
COUNCILMEMBER TO REPRESENT CITIES WITHOUT PRESCRIPTIVE PUMPING 
RIGHTS ON THE BOARD OF THE SAN GABRIEL BASIN WATER QUALITY 
AUTHORITY 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Waive full reading and approve Resolution 2016-59. 

 
b. Consideration of Modifications to the San Dimas Municipal Code Chapter 8.40 of Title 8 

Regarding Residency Restrictions of Registered Sex Offenders 
 

     ORDINANCE 1252, AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF  
     SAN DIMAS REPEALING AND REPLACING SAN DIMAS MUNICIPAL CODE 
     CHAPTER 8.40 OF TITLE 8 REGARDING RESIDENCY RESTRICTIONS OF 
     REGISTERED SEX OFFENDERS (FIRST READING INTRODUCTION) 

 
     RECOMMENDED ACTION: Waive full reading and introduce Ordinance 1252. 
 

c. Introduction and first reading of Uniform Building Codes and set January 10, 2017 as date 
for public hearing and adoption. 

 
 ORDINANCE 1250, AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF  
 SAN DIMAS AMENDING SPECIFIED CHAPTERS OF TITLE 15 OF THE SAN DIMAS 
  MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2016 EDITION OF THE  
 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, VOLUMES 1 & 2, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
 ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL 
 CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS 
 CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, 
 AND EXCEPTIONS, INCLUDING FEES AND PENALTIES (FIRST READING AND 
 INTRODUCTION) 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Waive full reading and introduce Ordinance 1250. 

 



City Council Agenda 
December 13, 2016                                                                                                                                            Page 3 

 
6. SUCCESSOR AGENCY 
 
 a. Adopt provisions and take action to close-out the Historic Tax Credit Program for the 

Walker House Renovation Project 
 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Authorize the Executive Director to complete the five action 
items to close-out of the Historic Tax Credit Program for the Walker House. 

 
7. MEETING OF SAN DIMAS PUBLIC FACILITIES FINANCING CORPORATION 
 

a. Public Comments (This is the time set aside for members of the audience to address the Board.  
Speakers are limited to three minutes.) 

 
b. Approval of Minutes for meeting of December 8, 2015 (Receive and File) 

 
c. Election of Officers 

 
 d. Members of the Corporation 
 
8. MEETING OF SAN DIMAS HOUSING AUTHORITY CORPORATION 
 

a. Public Comments (This is the time set aside for members of the audience to address the Board.  
Speakers are limited to three minutes.) 

 
b. Approval of Minutes for meeting of December 8, 2015 (Receive and File) 

 
 c. Annual Audit Report for Authority (Receive and File) 
 
 d.  Administrative Services Agreement (Receive and File) 
 
       e. Annual Audit for the Charter Oak Mobile Home Community (Receive and File) 
 
 f. Election of Officers Members of the Authority 
 
9. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS 
 
 a. Members of the Audience (Speakers are limited to five (5) minutes or as may be determined by the 

Chair.) 
 

b. City Manager 
  

1) Downtown Project Update 
 
2) Report regarding questions brought up at the November 22, 2016, council 
       meeting regarding the Grove Station and Village Walk Homeowners Associations  
 (Receive and file) 

 
 c. City Attorney 
 

d. Members of the City Council 
 
1) Reappointment of Public Safety Commissioners  

 
2) Councilmembers' report on meetings attended at the expense of the local agency. 
 



City Council Agenda
December 13, 2016                                                                                                                                            Page 4

3) Individual members' comments and updates.

10. ADJOURNMENT

The next meeting will be on January 10, 2017, 5:00 p.m. joint study session with the Planning 
Commission.

____________________________________________________________________

Notice Regarding American with Disabilities Act: In compliance with the 
ADA, if you need assistance to participate in a city meeting, please contact the 
City Clerk’s Office at (909) 394-6216.  Early notification before the meeting you 
wish to attend will make it possible for the City to make reasonable arrangements 
to ensure accessibility to this meeting [28 CFR 35.102-35.104 ADA Title II]. 

Copies of documents distributed for the meeting are available in alternative formats upon 
request. Any writings or documents provided to the City Council regarding any item on this 
agenda will be made available for public inspection at the Administration Counter at City Hall 
and at the San Dimas Library during normal business hours. In addition most documents are 
posted on the City’s website at cityofsandimas.com. 

Posting Statement: On December 9th, 2016 a true and correct copy of this agenda was posted on 
the bulletin board at 245 East Bonita Avenue (San Dimas City Hall), 145 North Walnut Avenue 
(Los Angeles County Library), 300 East Bonita Avenue (United States Post Office), Von’s 
Shopping Center (Puente/Via Verde Avenue) and the City’s website 
www.cityofsandimas.com/minutes.cfm

http://www.cityofsandimas.com/minutes.cfm


RESOLUTION 2016-58 

 

   A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 

   CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, APPROVING 

CERTAIN DEMANDS FOR THE MONTHS OF NOVEMBER 

AND DECEMBER 2016  

                   

 

 WHEREAS, the following listed demands have been audited by the Director of Finance; 

and 

 

 WHEREAS, the Director of Finance has certified as to the availability of funds for 

payment thereto; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the register of audited demands have been submitted to the City Council for 

approval. 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of San 

Dimas does hereby approve Prepaid Warrant Register 11/30/16 in the amount of $871,286.78 

checks (25942-25991); and Warrant Register 12/15/16 in the amount of $766,342.26 checks  

(157200-157318). 

 

  

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 13
th
, day of December 2016. 

 

 

 

 

     ___________________________________________ 

       Curtis W. Morris, Mayor City of San Dimas 

ATTEST: 

 

 

____________________________ 

Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk 

 

 

 I, DEBRA BLACK, ASSISTANT CITY CLERK, HEREBY CERTIFY that 

Resolution 2016-58 was approved by vote of the City Council of the City of San Dimas at its 

regular meeting of December 13
th

, 2016 by the following vote: 

 
AYES:  
NOES:   
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:  

   

 

      ________________________________ 

      Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk 

3a



 

 

11/30/2016 

PREPAID 

WARRANT REGISTER 

Ck#’s 25942 - 25991 

Total:  $871,286.78 

 

 













































 

 
 

CITY COUNCIL: 
Mayor Curtis W. Morris 
Mayor Pro Tem Emmett Badar  
Councilmember Denis Bertone 
Councilmember John Ebiner 
Councilmember Jeff Templeman 
 
Planning Commission Chair David Bratt 
Planning Commission Vice Chair John Davis 
Planning Commissioner Margie Green 
Planning Commissioner Tomas Molina  
Planning Commissioner Ted Ross 
 
STAFF: 
Assistant City Manager Ken Duran 
Assistant City Manager Community Development Larry Stevens 
City Attorney Mark Steres 
Director of Parks and Recreation Theresa Bruns 
Director of Public Works Krishna Patel 
 
CALL TO ORDER 
 
Mayor Morris called the meeting to order at 5:00 p.m.  
 
 

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS  
 
None. 
 

STUDY SESSION – Report on the Downtown Specific Plan 
 
Mr. Stevens reported that the purpose of the Study Session is to provide the Council and 
Commission with a preview of the proposed new downtown Specific Plan.  He added that staff is 
not asking for any decisions but would like feedback.  He reminded them that the City received a 
SCAG grant to facilitate a process to develop a new downtown Specific Plan and of the 
community outreach process that was facilitated by the consultant. 
 
Mr. Stevens reviewed the seven goals that are the objective in creating the Specific Plan and 
explained the concepts of a form based Code.  He explained that the Specific Plan would be 
divided up into four zoning districts and other overlays.  He further described each of the four 
zones and referenced maps identifying the geographic boundaries of each zone. 
 

 
SPECIAL JOINT CITY COUNCIL AND PLANNING 

COMMISSION STUDY SESSION MINUTES 
TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 22, 2016, 5:00 P. M.                                                         

SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 
245 E. BONITA AVE. 

3b



Study session minutes 
November 22, 2016                                                                                                                                            Page 2 
 
 
In discussion of the General Neighborhood Zone Councilmember Templeman commented that 
the proposed map does not show the south side of 1st Street as General Neighborhood even 
though they are single family residential.  Mr. Stevens replied that staff is still evaluating the 
maps and that is one area that is being looked at as to what is the appropriate Zone. 
 
Mr. Stevens described that there are nine different building types and each Zone is designated 
with building types that are allowed within that Zone.  He described and provided examples of 
building types.  He also described that in addition to building types there are also nine different 
frontage types and provided examples. 
 
Mr. Stevens further reviewed the proposed Zone map but indicated that it is still under review by 
staff and it will definitely have changes to it.  He added that one area that staff is reviewing is 
how far north on San Dimas Ave. to take the Specific Plan.  Commissioner Davis commented 
that he would like to see the Plan go further north on San Dimas Ave.  In response to a question 
Mr. Stevens commented that due to the existing mix of office professional and residential that 
changes due to the Specific Plan would create non-conforming uses.  Mayor Morris commented 
that he has concerns with the impacts on property owners with having a non-conforming use 
designation.  There was discussion on non-conforming uses and the implications of that 
designation.  Mr. Stevens commented that he understands the concerns and that there needs to be 
flexibility to account for existing single family uses on San Dimas Ave. so they are not 
considered non-conforming.  He added that maybe a Town Urban designation may be beneficial 
and that staff will do more analysis as to the appropriate designation. 
 
Councilmember Templeman asked if anything in the Specific Plan addresses appropriate 
building materials.  Mr. Stevens responded that building materials are addressed in the Town 
Core Guidelines.  Councilmember Templeman commented that the list of homes subject to the 
Town Core Guidelines needs to be revisited since a majority of the homes have been modified 
and don’t currently meet the guidelines. 
 
Commissioner Davis commented that on the map the gas station is designated as a park.  Mr. 
Stevens responded that ultimately that may be the best use for the property but he will look at a 
designation that reflects the current use but leaves open the option for open space. 
 
Mr. Stevens provided and explanation and examples of how various standards would be applied 
to each of the Zones. 
 
Mr. Stevens reviewed several issues and concerns that need to be discussed and addressed.  The 
first being that the proposed parking standards significantly reduces the number of required 
parking spaces for new or renovated properties.  He added that the parking reduction may go too 
far given the existing parking constraints.  There was quite a bit of discussion on the existing 
shortage of parking and parking constraints in the downtown.  Mr. Stevens commented that staff 
will do more analysis on existing available parking and current and proposed parking standards.  
The consensus was that there is a need for a parking management plan for the public lots and the 
downtown. 
 
Mr. Stevens used the Bonita/Cataract property and the hotel proposal as an example of how the 
form based code would be applied.  He reviewed the proposed set-backs and building types.  He 
added that in the Town Core Zone residential could be permitted if all the building standards are 



Study session minutes 
November 22, 2016                                                                                                                                            Page 3 
 
 
met.  He further added that since the Council has previously determined that they do not desire 
residential on this site that the zoning code may want to asterisk this site as not permitted for 
residential.  The consensus was that the site should be designated as not permitted for residential. 
 
Mr. Stevens explained that another issue area is the properties that are currently in SP 23 and are 
preliminarily proposed for the Town Urban Zone, which would include residential uses.  There 
was discussion on whether or not these properties should be included.  It was the consensus to 
remove these properties for now.  Staff indicated a preference for preserving options on this 
issue. 
 
Mr. Stevens reported the other issue area is properties impacted by the future Gold Line 
extension.  He added that the Specific Plan would assume that the station would be near the city 
maintenance yard as previously directed by the Council.  He added that the Plan does not address 
the manner of how the Bonita/Cataract intersection will be addressed or impacted.  In response to 
a question Mr. Stevens responded that with the passage of Measure M the Gold Line Authority is 
pushing the City to make decisions on the station location and Bonita/Cataract intersection.  He 
added that staff will seek input from the Council, probably in January, on these issues. 
 
Mr. Stevens presented a timeline of the next steps including a community outreach meeting in 
January, Planning Commission hearing in February and City Council hearing in March.  He 
added that the timing to expend the grant funds is expiring and any delays in the process may 
require the City to spend some money towards the consultant.  The consensus was to move 
forward with the process to get it finished under the grant timeline. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
 
The meeting adjourned at 7:00 p.m. 
 
 
_____________________________   ________________________________ 
Ken Duran, City Clerk    Curtis W. Morris, Mayor 
 
  
 
 



REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING MINUTES
                 TUESDAY NOVEMBER 22, 2016, 7:00 P. M.                                                 

SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS
245 E. BONITA AVENUE

CITY COUNCIL:
Mayor Curtis W. Morris
Mayor Pro Tem Emmett Badar 
Councilmember Denis Bertone
Councilmember John Ebiner
Councilmember Jeff Templeman

STAFF:
Assistant City Manager Ken Duran
City Attorney Mark Steres
Assistant City Manager of Development Services Larry Stevens
Director of Parks and Recreation Theresa Bruns
Director of Public Works Krishna Patel
Assistant City Clerk Debra Black

CALL TO ORDER AND FLAG SALUTE

Mayor Morris called the meeting to order and led the flag salute at 7:07 p.m.

ANNOUNCEMENTS

Holiday Extravaganza and Tree Lighting

Theresa Bruns Director of Parks and Recreation provided the announcement of activities and 
timeline for the event.

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS (Members of the audience are invited to address the City 
Council on any item not on the agenda.  Under the provisions of the Brown Act, the 
legislative body is prohibited from taking or engaging in discussion on any item not 
appearing on the posted agenda.  However, your concerns may be referred to staff or set for 
discussion at a later date.  If you desire to address the City Council on an item on this agenda, 
other than a scheduled public hearing item you may do so at this time or asked to be heard 
when that agenda item is considered. Comments on public hearing items will be considered 
when that item is scheduled for discussion. The Public Comment period is limited to 30 
minutes.  Each speaker shall be limited to three (3) minutes.)

Members of the Audience

Seeing no one come forward the Mayor moved on to the consent calendar.



City Council Minutes 
November 22, 2016                                                                                                         Page 2 
 
 
CONSENT CALENDAR 
(All items on the Consent Calendar are considered to be routine and will be enacted by one 
motion unless a member of the City Council requests separate discussion.) 

 
 a. Resolutions read by title, further reading waived, passage and adoption recommended as 

follows: 
 

RESOLUTION 2016-57, A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, APPROVING CERTAIN DEMANDS 
FOR THE MONTH OF NOVEMBER 2016. 

 
a. Approval of minutes for regular City Council meeting of November 9th, 2016 

 
END OF CONSENT CALENDAR 
 
Councilmember Ebiner requested correction of the minutes of October 17, 2016 page four to 
reflect the date of the emergency exercise as October 20, 2016. 
 
MOTION: Motion/second by Councilmember Bertone/Ebiner to approve the consent calendar 
with the noted corrections. The motion passed by unanimous vote. (5-0) 
 
YES:    Badar, Bertone, Ebiner, Morris, Templeman 
NOES:   None 
ABSENT:  None 
ABSTAIN:  None 
 
OTHER BUSINESS  
 
Waste Management Annual Rate Increase 

 
Assistant City Manager Ken Duran presented staff’s report on this item 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approve the 1.73% rate increase for residential and commercial 
services as requested by Waste Management effective January 1, 2017 and the commercial 
recycling cart rates and $50 overage charge rate. 

 
Councilmember Bertone asked how our city rates compared to other cities. 
 
Mr. Duran responded that when the original agreement was adopted a rate comparison was 
done and our rates lean towards the high side but that takes into account a 19% franchise fee. He 
added that we are entering into the last year of the agreement and rates will be one of the items 
negotiated. 
 
Teri Muse Waste Management representative spoke on the businesses compliance with AB341. 
In response to Councilmember Bertone’s question Ms. Muse added that any business that 
generates four yards of trash or more per week are required to comply. 
 
Councilmember Ebiner asked how Waste Management knows when a business has an 
overflow situation. 



City Council Minutes 
November 22, 2016                                                                                                         Page 3 
 
 
Ms. Muse answered there is a program where drivers use tablets to take pictures of the overflow 
incidents which are then added to the account information. The business is sent a notification of 
the observation with an explanation of what happens if there are any future occurrences. 
 
MOTION: Motion/second by Councilmember Templeman/Badar to approve the 1.73% rate 
increase for residential and commercial services as requested by Waste Management effective 
January 1, 2017 and the commercial recycling cart rates and $50 overage charge rate. The 
motion passed by unanimous vote. (5-0) 
 
YES:    Badar, Bertone, Ebiner, Morris, Templeman 
NOES:   None 
ABSENT:  None 
ABSTAIN:  None 
 
Bonita Avenue Project Update with Power Point 
 
Krishna Patel Director of Public Works gave an update accompanied by a Power Point 
Presentation. 
 
Councilmember Bertone asked for a completion date. 
 
Mr. Patel answered that 90% of the work could be done before Christmas. 
 
ORAL COMMUNICATIONS 
 
 a. Members of the Audience (Speakers are limited to five (5) minutes or as may be 

determined by the Chair.) 
 
Ryan Vienna resident and President of the San Dimas Village Walk Corporation spoke on the 
Grove Station and Village Walk Corporation CC&R’s issues with the trash enclosures and water 
services. 

 
b. City Manager 
 
      Homeless Shelter and Transportation Schedule for 2016-17 
 

Mr. Duran presented this item to council.  
 
c. City Attorney 

 
Nothing to report. 
 

d. Members of the City Council 
 
  City Representative for the Mosquito Vector Control District 
 
Mr. Duran presented this item to council for appointment or for placement on a future agenda. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Discuss and consider making an appointment. 
 



City Council Minutes 
November 22, 2016                                                                                                         Page 4 
 
 
Councilmember Templeman clarified that his last meeting will be December and an 
appointment is needed for the January 2017 meeting. 
 
ACTION TAKEN: After some discussion Councilmember Badar announced he would attend 
the meetings from January thru March 2017 with a future discussion on a permanent 
appointment to come. 
 
Councilmember Templeman requested a letter from the City Manager be sent to Ken Fujioka. 
 
  2)   Councilmembers' report on meetings attended at the expense of the local agency 
 
No meeting attended 
 
  3)  Individual Members' comments and update 
 
CLOSED SESSION 
 

1) CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL - EXISTING LITIGATION  
Pursuant to Paragraph (1) of subdivision (d) of Government Code Section    
54945.9.  

 
Name of Case:  Frank Lindsay v. City of San Dimas, United States District Court, 
Civil Action No. 2:16-cv-08344-JAK-AGR 

 
ADJOURNMENT 
 
The meeting recessed to a closed session at 7:45 p.m. Closed session adjourned at 8:30 p.m. with 
no reportable action. 
 
 
___________________________________                  __________________________________ 
Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk        Curtis W. Morris, Mayor 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 
 
 

Agenda Item Staff Report 
 

 
TO:   Honorable Mayor and Members of City Council 
   For the Meeting of December 13, 2016 
 
FROM:  Blaine Michaelis, City Manager 
 
INITIATED BY: Theresa Bruns, Director of Parks and Recreation 
 
SUBJECT: Reject Low Bidder, Principles Contracting, Inc., and Award 

Construction Contract 2016-03, Via Verde Park Improvement 
Project, to Micon Construction, Inc. in the amount of $432,744 and 
allocate a total project budget of $558,081. 

 
 

SUMMARY 
 

A request for the City Council to reject Principles Contracting, Inc. as low 
bidder and award Construction Contact 2016-03, Via Verde Park 
Improvement Project to Micon Construction, Inc. in the amount of $432,744, 
with a total budget allocation of $558,081. 

 

 
BACKGROUND 
 
Sealed bids were received by the City Clerk’s office and publicly opened on Tuesday, 
November 8, 2016 at 10:00 a.m., for Construction Contract 2016-03, Via Verde Park 
Improvement Project. 
 
The bid results were as follows: 
 

Company Name Total Base Bid Alt Bid “A” 
Playground 

Surface Materials 
Substitution 

Alt Bid #1 
Landscape 
Planters at 

Entry 

Alt Bid #2 
Wood 

Constructed 
Shade Shelter 

Alt Bid #3 
Prefabricated 
Metal Shade 

Structure 

Principles Contracting Inc. $420,000.00 $111,036.00 $5,578.00 $30,000.00 $46,000.00 
Micon Construction Inc. $425,723.00 $81,816.00 $6,991.00 $24,553.00 $36,767.00 
Aramexx Construction $427,824.00 $95,000.00 $15,817.00 $42,000.00 $62,000.00 
Cornerstone Renovation $486,570.75 $82,800.00 $24,017.18 $20,700.00 $39,100.00 
Act 1 $559,689.50 $87,660.00 $43,620.00 $23,590.00 $49,800.00 
1ST California Construction $769,213.13 $73,050.00 $32,312.50 $53,480.00 $64,620.00 
 
The project features a tot lot/elementary age playground in a newly designed ADA compliant 
expanded play areas and pathways.  The upgrades include, but are not limited to, ADA and 
California Title 24 Accessibility including new benches, picnic tables, a gazebo area with 
BBQ Grill, new swings and playground equipment for ages 2 to 5 and 5 to 12, new 
playground surfacing, new paths of travel for ADA Accessibility, landscape and irrigation 

 

3c



 

demolition and installation.  The play equipment and swings will provide inclusive play 
elements. 
 
The project specifications provide for the contract documents to be returned to the City 
within fourteen (14) calendar days of the award of contract, for work to commence within ten 
(10) calendar days of the Notice to Proceed, and for work to be completed within eighty (80) 
working days of commencement of work.  If rain days are needed, they will be negotiated 
with the contractor on an as needed basis and added to the schedule.  The contractor will 
be responsible for securing the site.  
 
The project also includes a ninety (90) day maintenance and establishment period following 
the completion of installation. 
 
 
ANALYSIS 
 
Staff has reviewed the bid proposal, bid bond and references provided by the low bidder, 
Principles Contracting, Inc. (Principles) and verified that the contractor's bid bond is issued 
by an admitted surety, as required by Public Contract Code 20170.  In verifying the 
contractor’s license through the California State Contractor's License Board, it was 
discovered that the contractor's license No. 982517 is current and active, but there is 
pending disciplinary action against the licensee in the form of an accusation.   
 
The Accusation, filed by the Contractors’ State License Board (CSLB), Department of 
Consumer Affairs, alleges that the Responsible Managing Operator of Principles 
Contracting, Inc., Jeffrey Ross Signor, committed a willful and fraudulent act when he signed 
the application for Contractor’s State License No. 982517, and under penalty of perjury 
certified that all statements on that application were true and accurate.  The CSLB alleges 
that Mr. Signor marked “NO” in response to the question on the application which asked, “To 
the best of your knowledge, is anyone listed on this application (or any company the person 
is or was a part of, or any immediate family member of the applicant) named in or 
responsible for any entered and unsatisfied judgments, liens, and/or claims against any 
bond or cash deposit pertaining to a construction project?”; and at that time there were four 
unsatisfied, pending civil lawsuits against Nature Tech Landscaping Inc., the company for 
which Mr. Signor held a contractor’s license at that time. 
 
An Accusation is a disciplinary action that has been referred to the Office of the Attorney 
General and, if proven, may result in the suspension or revocation of a license.  Licensees 
have the right to appeal a disciplinary action and no conclusion or judgment as to the validity 
of any charges should be assumed until the legal action process has been completed.  The 
status of the Accusation against Principles Contracting, Inc., complaint number N2015-323, 
is currently pending with an appeal hearing scheduled for March 22, 2017.  March 22, 2017 
will be approximately day 50 in the Via Verde Park project schedule. 
 
While Principles license is current and active at this time, and their performance references 
are adequate, staff recommends rejection of them as non-responsible low bidder pursuant 
to Public Contracts Code section 1103 which defines: “A responsible bidder is one who is 
able to perform the contract if awarded.  To be considered responsible, the bidder must 
demonstrate the attributes of trustworthiness, quality, fitness, capacity, and experience to 
satisfactorily perform the public works contract.”  A range of factors may be used to 
determine bidder responsibility, including performance history, reliable financial information, 



 

bonding and insurance capacity, public works experience, personnel, litigation history, and 
others.   
 
Staff notified Principals on November 16, 2016 via email as well as US mail of the intent to 
recommend rejection of their bid and offered them an opportunity to respond.  That same 
day a letter was received from Principles legal counsel, Robert F. Schauer, via email, and 
later US mail, requesting a hearing. 
 
Staff and City Attorney Steres conducted a hearing with Mr. Signor and Mr. Schauer on 
November 29, 2016 at which time they expressed their certainty that Principles will prevail in 
the March 22, 2017 Accusation hearing and will be able to complete the Via Verde Park 
project.  They further explained that they have been awarded other municipal projects.  
When specifically asked if they have ever been rejected as low bidder for a project since the 
time of the pending disciplinary action, they answered “no, only challenged” when first 
asked, and “no” when asked a second time.  Staff was previously aware of the City of 
Diamond Bar on August 16, 2016 rejecting Principles as low bidder on a park improvement 
project on the grounds of non-responsibility. 
 
Based upon the uncertainty of the ongoing status of Principles Contracting, Inc. license 
throughout the work schedule for the Via Verde Park Improvement project and the lack of 
truthfulness in response, staff recommends that City Council reject low bidder Principles 
Contracting, Inc. as a non-responsible bidder pursuant to Public Contracts Code 1103 and 
recommend that the contract be awarded to the second lowest responsible bidder. 
 
Staff has reviewed the bid proposal, bid bond and references provided by the second low 
bidder, Micon Construction, Inc. and verified that the contractor's bid bond is issued by an 
admitted surety, as required by Public Contract Code 20170.  It was confirmed through the 
California State Contractor's License Board that the contractor's license No. 744198 is 
current and active, and references report exemplary work.  
 
 
BUDGET 
 
The bid process included four alternative bids in addition to the based bid for the project.   

 
Alternative Bid “A” is a production substitution for tot lot rubber surfacing.  Included in the 
base bid is a line item for standard rubberized surfacing, and bid alternative “A” is specific to 
CalRecycle qualified rubberized surfacing.  Staff included the alternative product in the bid 
pricing as a CalRecycle grant application had been submitted just prior to the project going 
to bid.  Subsequently, the City was successfully awarded the grant and will be eligible for 
grant reimbursement of up to $8,125 for this project, therefore Alternative Bid “A” is included 
in the project budget allocation as itemized below, and item #35 of the base bid is deducted 
from the base bid pricing. 

 
Alternative Bid “#1” is for landscape planters to be installed at the entryway to the park.  This 
item is not included in the project budget, as they are not essential to the project. 
 
Alternative Bid “#2” is for a wood constructed shade structure, and Alternative Bid “#3” is for 
a prefabricated metal shade structure.  These items were included for pricing comparison, 
and the wood constructed structure will be included in the project and is itemized in the 
budget. 



 

 
A budget of $480,000 was allocated in the 2016-17 Park Development Fund 20 for the Via 
Verde Park Improvement Project, and staff recommends an additional budget allocation of 
$78,081 based on the following project costs: 
 
Micon Construction, Inc. Base Bid       $   425,723 
Delete Bid Item #35 - Totlot Rubber Surfacing  -  $     99,348 
Add Alt Bid “A” - Totlot Surfacing Substitution  + $     81,816 
Add Alt Bid #2 - Wood Constructed Shade Structure + $     24,553 
 
Total Construction Contract – Micon Construction, Inc.    $   432,744 
 
Construction Contingency – 10%       $      43,275 
Playground Equipment – Miracle Equipment      $      70,062 
Soils & Site Survey         $      12,000 
 
Total Project Budget         $    558,081 
 
A total budget allocation of $558,081 is requested, with the unallocated General Fund 
Reserves to be utilized for the $78,081 difference between the requested allocation and the 
budgeted allocation.  Use of the unallocated General Fund Reserves for this purpose was 
discussed at the October City Council study session. 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
 
Staff recommends that the City Council reject the low bid proposal from Principles 
Contracting, Inc., award Construction Contract 2016-03, Via Verde Park Improvement 
Project to Micon Construction, Inc. for the total contract price of $432,744 with a budget 
allocation of $558,081. 
 
Respectfully Submitted, 
 

 
 
Theresa Bruns 
Director of Parks and Recreation 
 
 
Attachments:  

 
- Staff Letter to Principles Contracting, Inc. 
- Contractor’s License Detail for License #982517, Principles Contracting, Inc. 
- Accusation Case No. N2015-323 Against Principles Contracting, Inc. 
- Letter from Robert Schauer, Legal Counsel 
 



City Council
CURTIS W. MORRIS, Mayor
EMMETT BADAR, Mayor Pro Tem
DENIS BERTONE
JEFF TEMPLEMAN 
JOHN EBINER

City Manager
BLAINE M. MICHAELIS

Assistant City Manager 
Treasurer/City Clerk
KENNETH J. DURAN

Assistant City Manager of
Community Development
LAWRENCE STEVENS

Director of Public Works
KRISHNA PATEL

Director of Parks
and Recreation
THERESA BRUNS

City Attorney
MARK W. STERES

November 16, 2016

Principles Contracting, Inc.
Jeff Signor, Vice President
1760 Marlborough Avenue
Riverside, CA 92507

Re: Via Verde Park Improvement Project
Construction Contract No. 2016-03

Dear Mr. Signor:

The purpose of this letter is to inform you of the status of your bid submittal 
for the above referenced project.  At the public bid opening conducted on 
November 8, 2016, Principles Contracting, Inc. was the apparent low bidder 
of the bids received; however, upon conducting due diligence on your 
company’s ability to demonstrate to be the lowest “responsible” bidder 
pursuant to Public Contract Code section 1103 (….a bidder who has 
demonstrated the attribute of trustworthiness, as well as quality, fitness, 
capacity, and experience to satisfactorily perform the public works contract), 
City staff has determined that Principles Contracting, Inc. does not meet this 
requirement based on the following:

• Pending Disciplinary Action against Contractor’s License #982517 
in the form of an Accusation filed by the State Attorney General’s 
Office, Case No. N2015-323, for violation of State law. A hearing 
is scheduled for March 22, 2017.

• The Accusation charges Principles Contracting Inc., Jeffrey Ross 
Signor and/or Deaudra Saile Barker-Signor, with falsifying an 
application to the State Contractor’s License Board.  Specifically, 
falsely claiming to not be listed or responsible for any “entered or 
unsatisfied judgments, liens, and/or claims against any bond or cash 
deposits pertaining to a construction project.”  

• The Accusation specifically identifies four unsatisfied civil lawsuits 
against Nature Tech Landscaping Inc., a former company of the 
Signor’s, at the time of the application.



Re: Via Verde Park Improvement Project 
  Page  
November 15, 2016 

2  

• The Accusation includes a history of suspensions for Contractor’s 
License Number 982517 for violations of the Business and 
Professions Code.  

• The Accusation also notes a significant history of litigation in which 
Mr. Signor and/or his previous company, Nature Tech Landscaping 
were named defendants. 

 
This letter is to provide you an opportunity to respond to these findings.  If 
you disagree with this assessment, please submit written evidence that 
rebuts this due diligence and clearly demonstrates that your firm is qualified 
to perform the Work as a responsible bidder no later than November 23, 
2016.  Written evidence shall be submitted to my attention: 
 
   Theresa Bruns 
   Director of Parks and Recreation  
   245 E. Bonita Avenue 
   San Dimas, CA 91773 
 
Without such evidence, City staff will be compelled to recommend award of 
the contract to the next lowest responsible bidder. 
 
You me contact me at 909-394-6230 or at tbruns@ci.san-dimas.ca.us if you 
have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 
 

 
 
Theresa Bruns 
Director of Parks and Recreation’ 
 
 
 
Attachments 
 
 
cc Blaine Michaelis, City Manager 
  Ken Duran, Assistant City Manager 
  Mark Steres, City Attorney 

mailto:tbruns@ci.san-dimas.ca.us




































3d









 

 
 

Agenda Item Staff Report 

 
 
To: Honorable Mayor and Members of City Council  
 December 13, 2016 
 
From: Blaine Michaelis, City Manager 
 
Initiated by:  Larry Stevens, Community Development Department 
 

 Subject:           Municipal Code Text Amendment 16-01 - Consideration of a an amendment to 
                          update Municipal Code Section 18.38 (Second Dwelling Units) in response to 
                                                  SB1069 and AB2299, including revisions to parking and other standards 

_____________________________________________________________________________  
  

SUMMARY 
 

The proposed Municipal Code Text Amendment intends to update the City 
Second Unit ordinance by adding various changes required by SB 1069 

and AB 2299. In addition the City proposes to increase the eligible 
residents to include senior citizens, caregivers and disabled persons who 

might not meet the affordability standards. 
 

Staff and Planning Commission recommend approving MCTA 16-01. 

 
BACKGROUND 
In 1993 the City of San Dimas established Chapter 18.38 allowing second units as required by 
Government Code Section 65852.2. In 2003 The City amended its second unit regulations to 
address updated changes in State law. 
 
This year the State Legislature amended Government Code Section 65852.2 making further 
revisions to second unit law as set forth in SB 1069 and AB 2299 (copies attached). These 
changes primarily relates to processing time, parking requirements for second units (now called 
accessory dwelling units or ADUs), setbacks and utility connections and fees. These changes 
take effect January 1, 2017. 
 
There are approximately 15 second units in the City. 
 
 

4a



MCTA 16-01 - ADUs Page 2
December 13, 2016

DISCUSSION/ANALYSIS
The primary changes include:

1. Changing the name of “second units” to “accessory dwelling units (ADUs)”.
2. Establishing a maximum of 120 days to review an application for an ADU.
3. Requiring parking to be waived under certain circumstances
4. Limiting fees for utility connections and related capacity charges
5. Allowing setback revisions under certain circumstances for garage converted units
6. Restricting requirements for fire sprinklers

In addition to these changes the adopted Housing Element contains, in part, the following 
objective:

Review and refine the City’s second unit ordinance to facilitate options for seniors, 
persons with disabilities, caregivers and other lower and extremely low income 
households.

In considering the proposed amendment the Planning Commission discussed the following key 
points (see attached Draft minutes):

• Clarification of the applicability of the garage conversion option, the minimum lot size 
standard, ADA applicability and the fire sprinkler limitation

• Possible increased demand resulting from these changes
• Opportunity for units to become part of sharing economy (i.e. Air BnB, etc.) and to be 

occupied as mini-dorms
• Clarification of the transit stop frequency standard

No one appeared at the public hearing.

RECOMMENDATION

Staff and Planning Commission recommend approval of MCTA 16-01 as set forth in the attached 
Ordinance.

Respectfully submitted,

Larry Stevens, Assistant City Manager for Community Development

Attachments:
1. Ordinance 1251
2. Planning Commission Resolution PC-1570
3. Draft Planning Commission Minutes for November 17, 2016
4. Planning Commission Staff Report dated November 17, 2016



ORDINANCE 1251 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS,  
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES ADOPTING MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT 

AMENDMENT 16-01 REVISING CHAPTER 18.38 (SECOND UNITS) TO BE 
CONSISTENT WITH STATE LAW CHANGES REGARDING ACCESSORY 

DWELLING UNITS (ADUs) 
 

WHEREAS, an Amendment to the San Dimas Municipal Code has been duly 
initiated by the City of San Dimas; and 
 

            WHEREAS, the Amendment is described as Consideration of a an amendment to 
update Municipal Code Section 18.38 (Second Dwelling Units) in response to SB1069 and 
AB2299, including revisions to parking and other standards; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Amendment would affect the areas of the City eligible for 
accessory dwelling units (ADUs) and 
 
 WHEREAS, notice was duly given of the public hearing on the matter and that 
public hearing was held on December 13, 2016 at the hour of 7:00 p.m., with all testimony 
received being made a part of the public record; and 
 
 WHEREAS, all requirements of the California Environmental Quality Act and the 
City’s Environmental Guidelines have been met for the consideration of whether the 
project will have a significant effect on the environment. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, the CITY COUNCIL of the CITY OF SAN DIMAS, 
County of Los Angeles does hereby ordain as follows: 
 
A. The proposed Municipal Code Text Amendment will not adversely affect adjoining 

property as to value, precedent or be detrimental to the area. MCTA 16-01 makes 
minor changes to existing second unit/ADU regulations consistent with new State 
laws. 

 
B. The proposed Municipal Code Text Amendment will further the public health, 

safety and general welfare. Proposed changes are minor and allow additional 
housing opportunities. 

 
C. The proposed Municipal Code Text Amendment is consistent with the General 

Plan. One of the revisions implements an objective set forth in the 2014- 21 
Housing Element regarding eligible residents for second units/ADUs. 

 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, PURSUANT TO THE 
ABOVE FINDINGS, that the City Council approves Municipal Code Text Amendment 
16-01 as set forth on Attached Exhibit A. 
 



Ordinance 1251                                                                                                Page 2 
MCTA 16-01 Second Dwelling Units 

 
SECTION I. SEVERABILITY. If any section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, 
clause, phrase, or portion of this Ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid or 
unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent jurisdication, such decision shall 
not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The City Council hereby 
declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance and each section, subsection, 
subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof, irrespective of the fact that any 
one or more section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof be 
declared invalid or unconstitutional. 
 
SECTION II. EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION. This Ordinance shall 
take effect 30 days after its final passage, and within 15 days after its passage the City 
Clerk shall cause it to be published in the Inland Valley Daily Bulletin, a newspaper of 
general circulation (GC§40806) in the City of San Dimas hereby designated for that 
purpose. 
 

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of San 
Dimas this ____ day of _____, 20__. 
 
 
      ____________________________________ 
      Curtis W. Morris, Mayor City of San Dimas 
 
 
ATTEST:     APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
____________________________  _______________________ 
Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk  Mark Steres, City Attorney 
 
 
 

I, DEBRA BLACK, ASSISTANT CITY CLERK of the City of San Dimas, do 
hereby certify that Ordinance 1251 was introduced at a regular meeting of the City Council 
of the City of San Dimas on the XX day of XXXX, 20XX, and thereafter passed, approved 
and adopted at a regular meeting of said City Council held on the XX day of XXXX, 
20XX, by the following vote: 

 
AYES: 
NOES: 
ABSENT: 
ABSTAIN: 

 
 

___________________________ 
 Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk 



Ordinance 1251                                                                                                Page 3 
MCTA 16-01 Second Dwelling Units 

 

EXHIBIT A 

1. Delete the text with the strike-throughs and add the text shown in red. 

Chapter 18.38 
 

SECOND ACCESSORY DWELLING UNITS 
 
Sections: 

18.38.010 Purpose. 
18.38.020 Permitted uses. 
18.38.030 General provisions. 
18.38.040 Development standards. 
18.38.050 Plan review. 
18.38.060 Appeals. 

 
18.38.010 Purpose. 
 A. The California State Legislature has identified in Government Code Section 65852.2 
that the need exists for new housing to shelter California’s population. The legislature has 
further declared that the state should increase housing resources and reduce the barriers to 
the provisions for affordable housing opportunities. Creating the opportunity to provide 
second residential accessory dwelling units on existing residential property with single-
family dwelling units is beneficial and would provide an additional resource for affordable 
housing within the community. 
 B. This chapter provides the opportunity to create second residential accessory dwelling 
units on existing residential property. For the purposes of this chapter, an “second 
residential accessory dwelling unit” is defined as either a detached or attached dwelling 
unit which provides complete, independent living facilities for one or more persons. An 
attached second accessory dwelling unit may be developed as a second story. This unit 
would include permanent provisions for living, sleeping, eating, cooking and sanitation on 
the same parcel as the primary unit is situated. In addition, the second accessory dwelling 
unit is a housing alternative designed to offer an affordable living opportunity. 
 C. Except as provided herein, an second residential accessory dwelling unit shall be 
prohibited in all single-family zones and on all multiple family zoned lots containing less 
than the minimum lot size for multiple dwelling units.  
 
18.38.020 Permitted uses. 
 A maximum of one second residential accessory dwelling unit shall be permitted on 
single-family zoned residential property (lots zoned SF or specific plans designated for 
single-family land use) or multiple-family zoned property improved with a single-family 
dwelling, subject to the provisions of this chapter.  
 



Ordinance 1251                                                                                                Page 4 
MCTA 16-01 Second Dwelling Units 

18.38.030 General provisions. 
 The following general provisions shall apply to all second residential accessory dwelling 
units: 
 A. Second residential Accessory dwelling units shall be permitted on single-family or 
multiple-family residential zoned property which contains an existing single-family 
residence at time of application, or is vacant and is to be developed in conjunction with the 
construction of the primary single-family residence. 
 B. Unless otherwise provided by the provisions of this chapter, an second residential 
accessory dwelling unit shall be permitted only on lots in which the improvements thereon 
conform to all minimum requirements of the applicable single-family, specific plan or 
multiple-family residential zone. 
 C. Second residential Accessory dwelling units may be rented, and shall not be 
separately sold or subdivided. The owner of the subject property shall be the occupant of 
either the primary residence or the second residential accessory dwelling unit, and such 
restriction shall be recorded on an instrument as approved by the city attorney and shall run 
with the land. 
 D. Affordable Rental Housing. All second residential accessory dwelling units which 
are rented shall be designated as “affordable” and shall conform to the following standards: 
 1. Said second residential accessory dwelling units shall be rented to “low” or “very 
low” income households as defined by the most currently published United States 
Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD) Income Limits for Los Angeles 
County. 
 2. The property owner of the property on which the second residential accessory 
dwelling unit is to be located shall enter into and record an affordable housing contract per 
the approval of the city attorney for a minimum term of fifty years with automatic renewal, 
or until the second residential accessory dwelling unit is removed, and such restriction shall 
run with the land. 
 3. The property owner of the second residential accessory dwelling unit shall comply 
and submit affordable housing reporting information as required by the Affordable 
Housing Agreement approved by, and on file with, the city. The agreement shall include a 
certified annual report submitted by the property owner to the city demonstrating 
compliance with the Affordable Housing Agreement. 
   4.   If the additional unit is rented, it shall be not be rented for terms less than thirty days. 
   5.  In lieu of being rented as an affordable unit pursuant to the subsection, the accessory 
dwelling unit may be rented to person(s) over the age of sixty-two, caregivers for a resident 
of one of the units on the property, and persons with disabilities who do not meet the 
income limitations set forth herein. The Affordable Housing Agreement is still required 
with any different tenancy to be reported on the certified annual report. 
 E. Equestrian Property. Notwithstanding any other provisions of this chapter, second 
residential accessory dwelling units shall be located in such a manner so as not to conflict 
with the equestrian setback standards on the subject property or adjoining properties, as set 
forth in this title. 
 F. Hillside Property. To minimize the amount of grading, single-family residential 
property located in hillside areas shall have sufficient existing flat pad area to support the 



Ordinance 1251                                                                                                Page 5 
MCTA 16-01 Second Dwelling Units 

placement of an second residential accessory dwelling unit. For the purposes of this 
section, hillside property shall be defined as provided in Chapter 18.164 of this title. 
 G. Discretionary Application. No variance, conditional use permit or other 
discretionary application shall be allowed in conjunction with the consideration of an 
application for an second accessory dwelling unit.  
 
18.38.040 Development standards. 
 The following property development standards shall apply to all second residential 
accessory dwelling units: 
 A. Minimum Lot Size. The following minimum lot area standards shall apply: 
 1. Ten thousand square feet or greater—attached or detached second residential 
accessory dwelling units, subject to the provisions of this chapter; 
 2. Less than nine thousand nine hundred ninety-nine square feet—No second residential 
accessory dwelling units are allowed. 
 B. Floor Area. The following floor area standards for second residential accessory 
dwelling units apply: 
 1. Attached second residential accessory dwelling units shall not exceed five hundred 
square feet; 
 2. Detached second residential accessory dwelling units shall not exceed: 
 a. Six hundred square feet on properties from ten thousand to twenty thousand square 
feet, 
 b. Seven hundred square feet on properties from twenty thousand one square feet up to 
one acre, 
 c. Eight hundred fifty square feet on properties over one acre; 

 3. A maximum of two bedrooms are permitted in any second residential accessory 
dwelling unit. 

      C.  Minimum Yard Areas. The following minimum yard requirements apply: 
 1. Front Yards. The provisions of the applicable underlying zoning designation of the 
subject property shall apply; 
 2. Side Yards and Corner Lots. The provisions of the applicable underlying zoning 
designation of the subject property shall apply; 
 3. Rear Yards. The minimum rear yard shall be three feet; 
 4. Nonconforming Residential Structures. The provisions of Chapter 18.24 shall apply 
to lots with an existing nonconforming primary residential dwelling unit which otherwise 
meets the current building and zoning code requirements. 
    5.  Existing Garage. No additional setback shall be required for an existing garage that is 
converted to an accessory dwelling unit although said conversion shall meet all 
requirements of the applicable building code. A setback of no more than five feet from side 
and/or rear lot lines shall be allowed for an accessory dwelling unit constructed above a 
garage provided said setback does not reduce access to required off street parking. 
 D. Building Height. The provisions of the applicable underlying zoning designation of 
the subject property shall apply. 
 E. Parking and Access. The following parking and access requirements shall apply: 
 1. In addition to the parking required for the primary dwelling unit, the second 
residential accessory dwelling unit shall provide a minimum of one garage parking space. 



Ordinance 1251                                                                                                Page 6 
MCTA 16-01 Second Dwelling Units 

The first two hundred fifty square feet of garage area shall not be counted as part of the 
floor area of the second accessory dwelling unit; all square footage over two hundred fifty 
square feet will count towards the floor area of the second accessory dwelling unit; 
 a. Said parking may be located in an existing driveway, in a required setback, or as a 
tandem design, but shall not impede access to the required parking for the primary 
residence. 
 b. Said parking shall be waived when the accessory dwelling unit is located in any of the 
following circumstances: 
 i. Within one-half mile of a permanent transit stop, including, but not limited to, a park 
and ride facility or bus stop, which shall be regularly operating on headway of fifteen 
minutes or less. 
 ii. Within an architectural or historical district designated on the State Register of 
Historic Places. 
 iii. Where the accessory dwelling unit is located entirely within an existing primary 
residence. 
 iv. Within five hundred feet of a designated car share location. 
 2. Direct access to the second accessory dwelling unit shall be provided from a public 
right-of-way. Access may be provided from either an alley or a public street. Front 
driveway access from a public street may be permitted if the driveway is a minimum of 
twelve feet wide and is accessible via the existing driveway apron. No secondary front 
driveway aprons shall be allowed to access the second residential accessory dwelling unit; 
 3. Corner Lots. Secondary driveways to access the second accessory dwelling unit from 
the side street may be permitted. The minimum secondary driveway width shall be twelve 
feet; 
 4. Alley Access. The second residential accessory dwelling unit shall take vehicular 
access from the alley if the property abuts an alley. 
 5.  If the existing off-street parking is proposed to be demolished in conjunction with 
development of an accessory dwelling unit, said parking shall be replaced in a manner 
required by Chapter 18.156 and the applicable zoning district. Said parking may be 
provided in a tandem design or by use of a mechanical parking lift. 
 F. Building Separation. The minimum separation for a detached second residential 
accessory dwelling unit from the primary dwelling unit shall be twenty feet. The building 
separation area shall not be used for parking purposes. No passageway shall be required for 
a detached accessory dwelling unit. 
 G. Building Entrance. The entrance to an attached second residential accessory dwelling 
unit shall be separate from the entrance to the primary dwelling unit and shall be designed 
in a manner so as to appear as a single residential dwelling unit. 
 H. Architectural Design. All second accessory dwelling units shall be designed to be 
compatible with the existing, or proposed, single-family residence located on the same 
property as set forth in Section 18.12.060. 
 I. Fire Sprinklers. Accessory dwelling units shall not be required to provide fire 
sprinklers if they are not required for the primary residence. 
   J.  Utilities. Accessory dwelling units shall not be considered new residential uses for the 
purposes of calculating city and county connection fees or capacity charges for utilities, 
including water and sewer service. 



Ordinance 1251                                                                                                Page 7 
MCTA 16-01 Second Dwelling Units 

   1.  When the accessory dwelling unit is within the existing residence, a new or separate 
utility meter shall not be required and a related connection or capacity fee may not be 
charged. 
  2.  When the accessory dwelling unit is attached or detached, a new or separate utility 
meter may be required. Any connection fee or capacity charge shall be proportionate to the 
burden of the proposed accessory dwelling unit based upon either its size or the number of 
plumbing fixtures for a water or sewer system. 
    IK.  Dedication and Improvements. All second accessory dwelling units shall comply 
with applicable requirements set forth in Sections 18.12.100 through 18.12.110.  
 
18.38.050 Plan review. 
 A. All second residential accessory dwelling units shall be reviewed and approved by 
the development plan review board. The board may impose conditions necessary or require 
modifications in proposed designs to ensure that the provisions of this chapter are complied 
with. The board may not deny an second accessory dwelling unit where it is a permitted 
use in the zone in which the property lies. 
 B. The application and material submittal requirements shall be pursuant to the 
provisions of Chapter 18.12.  
   C.   All applications shall be acted upon within 120 days of the application being deemed 
complete. 
 
18.38.060 Appeals. 
 Any aggrieved party may file an appeal of a decision of the development plan review 
board pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 18.212. Any appeal filed shall be limited to 
matters associated with the application of the provisions of this chapter to the second 
accessory dwelling unit request and shall not be based on objections to approving the 
second accessory dwelling unit as a use on property where the second accessory dwelling 
unit is permitted.  
 
 





















CITY OF SAN DIMAS
PLANNING COMMISSION

MINUTES
Regularly Scheduled Meeting

Thursday, November 17, 2016 at 7:00 p.m.
245 East Bonita Avenue, Council Chambers

Present
Chairman David Bratt
Commissioner John Davis
Commissioner Margie Green
Commissioner Tom Molina
Commissioner Ted Ross
Assistant City Manager Comm. Dev. Larry Stevens
Planning Manager Fabiola Wong
Planning Secretary Jan Sutton

CALL TO ORDER AND FLAG SALUTE

Chairman Bratt called the regular meeting of the Planning Commission to order at 7:00 p.m. and 
Commissioner Green led the flag salute. 

APROVAL OF MINUTES

1. September 15, 2016 (Davis absent)

MOTION:  Moved by Green, seconded by Ross to approve the Minutes of September 15, 2016.  
Motion carried 4-0-0-1 (Davis abstain).

PUBLIC HEARINGS

2. CONSIDERATION OF MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT AMENDMENT 16-01 – A request to 
update Municipal Code Section 18.38 Second Dwelling Units in response to SB1089 and 
AB2299, including revisions to parking and other standards City-wide.

Staff report presented by Assistant City Manager Larry Stevens who stated this is in 
response to two pieces of legislation that were passed this year.  When there are two bills that 
amend the same section of the Government Code, whichever the Governor signs first takes 
precedence, which made it more complicated to understand which of the new rules were 
adopted. The City’s focus has been on the chaptered version of both bills.  In general the name 
has been changed for the third time to Accessory Dwelling Unit (ADU); in the 1980’s they were
originally called Granny Flats and in the 1990’s they were renamed to second units.  Over the 
years standards have been amended in regards to the maximum size, parking, etc. and the City 



Planning Commission Minutes Page 2
November 17, 2016

amended the code in 2006 to adopt changes for minimum lot size, and maximum dwelling unit 
sizes.

The second substantive change is there is now a 120 day maximum review period from when a 
complete application is submitted, which is shorter than the 180 days allowed under the Permit 
Streamlining Act.  There are now requirements that under certain circumstances required 
parking for the unit is waived, but since none of the terms utilized to establish the opportunity for 
parking waivers were defined, Staff added defintions.  The legislation also places limitations on 
what city and county water and sewer agencies can charge for connection impact fees.  It does 
not affect private water companies like Golden State Water but that could change in the future;
therefore, at this point any collection of fees will be between the applicant and the water 
company.  Another change had to do with setbacks if a unit is constructed over an existing 
garage.  There is also a prohibition on requiring installation of fire sprinklers in a unit if the main 
house does not have them already.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated all of these changes were primarily intended to 
accomplish the goal of providing more housing and affordable housing in an effort to respond to 
how local governments were processing second unit permits.  Many of these changes were 
based on a study conducted by U.C. Berkeley which only looked at six Bay Area cities, and the 
professors who wrote the study even stated their study was limited in size and scope and broad 
references should not be drawn from it.  However, the Legislature used it as the basis for how 
all cities should approach accessory units.  The chart on pages 2 and 3 of the staff report show 
how all of required changes have been incorporated into the existing code section.  In regards 
to the parking waiver, since no definitions were given by the legislature, Staff has done so under 
Section 18.38.040.E.b and went over the various subsections.  In regards to the requirement for 
a waiver within 500 feet of a car share location, the word “designated” was added by Staff for 
when it is finally defined.  He felt that was something that was probably at least ten years down 
the road.  Most of these waiver conditions would not be applicable to San Dimas, but the City 
Attorney has reviewed the language and is comfortable that the City is in compliance.  

He stated the last change included was a discretionary one on the part of the City.  When the 
last General Plan Housing Element was adopted, one of the objectives was to review this code 
section for options that might allow seniors, disabled persons, and caregivers to occupy the 
second unit without having to comply with the income restriction of the covenant.  Staff has 
included language that would permit seniors over the age of 62, persons with disabilities, and 
caregivers to an occupant of a unit on the property.  While these categories would not be 
required to meet the low-income limits, most people in these categories probably meet those 
standards anyway.  One of the things the Council has said is that they don’t want properties in 
the single-family zone to become duplex real-income properties, so these new requirements 
meet the goals of the Housing Element while still complying with the Council’s direction.

There is an additional piece of legislation included in the package for a Junior Accessory 
Dwelling Unit (JADU).  Adoption of this language is currently volitional on the City’s part and is 
simply being provided as informational at this time.  If at some time the State law changes 
making them mandatory, Staff will amend the code then.  Staff is recommending the Planning 
Commission adopt Resolution PC-1570 recommending approval of M.C.T.A. 16-01.

Commissioner Molina asked if a unit was constructed on top of a garage, what are the 
requirements for fire sprinklers, and if this legislation was to promote affordable housing.  

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated if the main house does not have existing fire 
sprinklers, then a garage conversion or new unit above would not be required to install them but 
the applicant can if they want to.  However, they would have to construct the unit to be 



Planning Commission Minutes Page 3
November 17, 2016

compliant with fire code separation standards.  The idea is to promote affordable housing and 
eliminate unreasonable restrictions some cities were imposing to prevent them.  Most cities do 
not have an income restriction or owner occupancy requirement because it is not required by 
State law.  In San Dimas by maintaining the affordability and owner occupancy restrictions, and 
now allowing seniors, persons with disabilities, and caregivers, we are accomplishing something 
meaningful in that area.

Commissioner Molina asked would a unit need to be ADA compliant now that they can be 
used for persons with disabilities.  He also asked if there were many lots over 10,000 square 
feet in San Dimas, and if someone wanted to convert an existing garage, would it need to have 
a 10,000 square foot lot.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated since these are considered under single-family 
zoning, no unique ADA standards are required.  Someone can choose to install them but they 
are not required.  And over time tenancy will change so the next occupant may not be disabled.  
There are many 10,000 square foot lots in the city limits.  There are not that many in the 
downtown area, but the horsekeeping lots and custom home lots exceed that, as well as others 
scattered around the community.  If someone wanted to convert a garage, they would still need 
to meet the minimum lot size and provide three off-street parking spaces, including two in an 
enclosed garage for the main house.

Commissioner Green asked if we have turned down many requests for second units and if 
we expect these changes will bring in more requests to build them.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated we have never turned down an application for one, 
and did not think these changes will increase the number of requests we get, which usually 
average one per year.  We do not have discretionary authority over the application, we can only 
confirm that it meets all the code standards.

Commissioner Green asked if the second story constructed at 1315 Paseo Placita was built 
as a second unit.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated that was submitted as a two bedroom, second story 
addition to the original house, and while it might be characterized as something that could be 
easily converted because of the layout, during construction Staff had them remove things they 
installed that seemed to be too kitchen-like.  There are also probably conversions on small lots 
that were done without permits, and in some large custom houses are maid’s quarters that 
owners have tried to convert by adding kitchen facilities that we have had them remove.

Commissioner Green asked if there could be a future problem with these accessory units 
being rented as Airbnbs.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated there is a concern so Staff added Section 
18.38.030.D.4 that sets a minimum rental term of 30 days to try and prevent that.  The City does 
not have any regulations regarding short term rentals at this time, we only respond when a 
complaint is received.

Commissioner Ross asked if it would be possible to use one of these accessory units like a 
mini-dorm with 5-6 people in it.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated the maximum size for a unit under State standards 
is 1,200 square feet and two bedrooms, though per the City’s code the maximum is 850 square 
feet based on lot size.  If it was rented to several college students, their combined income would 



Planning Commission Minutes Page 4
November 17, 2016

need to meet the affordability limits.  If one was being used in that manner, most likely the 
owner would not report that on the annual certification form.

Commissioner Davis asked if the definition of what makes something an ADU is having a 
kitchen, and can a residential unit only have one kitchen.  He also asked if the ADU is detached, 
it has to be 20 feet away from the main dwelling unit.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated you have to have a kitchen to qualify as a separate 
ADU, and that a single-family residence is only allowed to have one kitchen.  Our code requires 
a 20-foot separation between the main house and the ADU, which is slightly larger than the 
Building Code requirement.

Commissioner Davis asked if there have been any studies that would show if there is any 
negative impact on having ADUs in a community like San Dimas.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated there is more of a perception that single-family 
properties should be for one single-family residential structure, which goes back to when the 
Council was moving away from duplex zoning in the downtown area.  Our standards were
created to have the least negative impact in single-family zones.

Commissioner Davis asked if the minimum lot size and maximum unit size were City 
requirements, and asked about the minimum rear yard setback of three feet.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated under State law the maximum size is 1,200 square 
feet and two bedroom, but you can have smaller units which is why we have a sliding scale 
based on lot size.  Setting a minimum lot size of 10,000 square feet is a local requirement.  In 
regards to the rear setback, in most of the residential zones there is no rear yard setback.  The 
place where it comes into play is if there is an alley.  The Building Code requires structures to 
be a minimum of three feet from a property line as long as the eaves do not extend beyond half 
the distance, there is a one-hour firewall, and no openings.  This requirement is intended to 
mimic the Building code, but there could be a few garages that are on the property line that 
might be an issue if converted which is why a minimum was established.

Commissioner Davis asked about the parking waiver requirement if within a half-mile of a 
transit stop, and if “regularly operating” meant only one-time a day or if it had to be the entire 24-
hour period.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated there is no definition but he would argue that it had 
to be operating on a daily basis during peak times to qualify.

Chairman Bratt opened the meeting for public hearing.  There being no response, the public 
hearing was closed.

Assistant City Manager Stevens added that the City sent letters of opposition on this 
legislation at the direction of the City Council.

Commissioner Davis stated he felt the addition of qualified renters to include seniors, persons 
with disabilities, or caregivers was a positive step.



Planning Commission Minutes Page 5
November 17, 2016

RESOLUTION PC-1570

A RESOLUTION OF THE PLANNING COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF 
SAN DIMAS, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, RECOMMENDING 
APPROVAL OF MUNICIPAL CODE TEXT AMENDMENT 16-01, A 
REQUEST TO REVISE CHAPTER 18.38 (SECOND UNITS) TO BE 
CONSISTENT WITH STATE LAW CHANGES REGARDING 
ACCESSORY DWELLING UNITS (ADUs)

MOTION: Moved by Davis, seconded by Ross to approve Resolution PC-1570 recommending 
approval to the City Council of Municipal Code Text Amendment 16-01.  Motion carried 
unanimously, 5-0.

ORAL COMMUNICATION

3. Community Development Department

Assistant City Manager Stevens reminded the Commission of the Joint Meeting with the 
City Council on November 22, 2016 at 5:00 p.m. to discuss the proposed Downtown Specific 
Plan.  They are projecting bringing this item to the Planning Commission for review sometime in 
February.  He stated the next Planning Commissioner’s Academy in March 2017 will be held at 
the LAX Marriott.

He stated of the three housing project applications they have received, Walbern on San Dimas 
Avenue is the furthest along in the review process so the Commission should be holding the 
public hearing in the early part of next year.  The others are still working on submittal issues.  
Grading for the NJD project may start after the first of the year for the main part of the project, 
while utility work could start in the next few weeks.

4. Members of the Audience

Carla Rickerd, 337 Cody Road, stated she has concerns with the Walbern project and the 
proposed re-zoning.  She did not want to see the equestrian property go away.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated Staff is aware of the neighbors’ comments and have 
a copy of the petition they circulated which will become part of the public record.  There will be 
more details available for the residents to consider at the next community meeting.

5. Planning Commission

Commissioner Davis asked if there was any news on the Gold Line construction schedule.

Assistant City Manager Stevens stated the Gold Line will be one of the first projects funded 
with the passage of Measure M.  There are currently funds available for 50% of the design/build 
plans, which would be ready around 2018-2019.  The Gold Line Authority projects a seven-year 
construction schedule, so it may be operational in late 2025 or early 2026.



Planning Commission Minutes Page 6
November 17, 2016

ADJOURNMENT

MOTION: Moved by Davis seconded by Ross to adjourn.  Motion carried unanimously, 5-0.
The meeting adjourned at 8:12 p.m. to the regular Planning Commission meeting scheduled for 
Thursday, December 1, 2016, at 7:00 p.m.

_______________________________
David A. Bratt, Chairman
San Dimas Planning Commission

ATTEST:

______________________________
Jan Sutton
Planning Commission Secretary

Approved:



 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

 

            

 
 
DAT
 
TO: 
 
FRO
 

         SUBJ

  

 
BAC
In 19
as re
seco
 
This 
maki
(copi
requ
setba
2017
 
Ther
 
 

E: No

 Pl

OM: Co

JECT: M
am
Dw
re

 

The pro
the City S
by SB 10

the eli
disable

 

CKGROUND
993 the City
equired by G
ond unit reg

year the St
ing further r
ies attache
irements fo
acks and ut
7. 

re are appro

ovember 17

lanning Com

ommunity D

unicipal Co
mendment 
welling Uni

evisions to p

oposed Mun
Second Un
069 and AB
igible resid

ed persons 

Staff re

D 
y of San Dim
Governmen
ulations to 

tate Legisla
revisions to
d). These c

or second u
tility connec

oximately 1

7, 2016 

mmission 

Developme

ode Text Am
to update M
ts) in respo
parking and

SU
nicipal Code
nit ordinance
B 2299. In a
ents to incl
who might 

ecommends

mas establi
nt Code Sec
address up

ature amen
o second un
changes pri
nits (now c
ctions and f

5 second u

 

Plan
Staf
 
 
 

ent Departm

mendment 
Municipal C
onse to SB
d other stan

UMMARY
e Text Ame
e by adding
addition the
ude senior 
not meet th

 
s approving

ished Chap
ction 65852
pdated chan

ded Govern
nit law as se
imarily relat

called acces
fees. These

units in the 

nning 
ff Rep

ment 

16-01 - Co
Code Sectio

1069 and A
ndards 

endment int
g various ch
e City propo
citizens, ca

he affordab

g MCTA 16-

pter 18.38 a
2.2. In 2003
nges in Sta

nment Cod
et forth in S
te to proces
ssory dwell
e changes 

City. 

 Comm
port 

nsideration
on 18.38 (S
AB 2299, in

tends to up
hanges req
oses to incr
aregivers a

bility standa

-01. 

allowing sec
3 The City a
ate law. 

de Section 6
SB 1069 an
ssing time, 
ing units or
take effect 

missio

n of an 
econd 

ncluding 

pdate 
quired 
rease 
nd 

ards. 

cond units 
amended it

65852.2 
nd AB 2299

parking 
r ADUs), 
January 1,

on 

ts 

 

 



MCTA 16-01       Page  
November 17, 2016 

2

ANALYSIS 
Two bills were separately adopted by the legislature affecting second units. Even 
though each bill contained some different provisions they are chaptered based 
upon the order they were signed by the Governor. The chaptered versions (in 
effect a merger of the two bills) are identical and are available in the attachments 
as follows: 
 

 SB 1069 – starting with Sec. 5.5 on pages 13-17 of the attachment 
 

 AB 2299 - starting with Sec. 1.5 on pages 5-9 of the attachment 
 

The changes in the bills require the City to further amend its second unit 
regulations to be in compliance with State law. It should be noted that the City 
wrote letters of opposition to both bills. 
 
The primary changes include: 

1. Changing the name of “second units” to “accessory dwelling units 
(ADUs).” 

2. Establishing a maximum of 120 days to review an application for an ADU. 
3. Requiring parking to be waived under certain circumstances. 
4. Limiting fees for utility connections and related capacity charges. 
5. Allowing setback revisions under certain circumstances for garage 

converted units. 
6. Restricting requirements for fire sprinklers. 

 
Many of these changes are based on a perception that cities were making it 
difficult for people to develop second units. Unfortunately the UC Berkeley study 
(“Yes in My Back Yard”) was very limited in scope to a few Bay Area cities but 
that did not preclude the legislature from adopting new State-wide standards 
using that study as its primary source. 
 
In addition to these changes the adopted Housing Element contains, in part, the 
following objective: 
 

Review and refine the City’s second unit ordinance to facilitate options for 
seniors, persons with disabilities, caregivers and other lower and 
extremely low income households. 

 
The attached Resolution contains each of these changes to bring the City’s 
ordinance into compliance with State law. 
 

Change Location Comment 
Rename as 
ADUs 

Throughout Chapter 18.38  

Review period Subsection C added to 
Section 18.38.050 

 



MCTA 16-01       Page  
November 17, 2016 

3

Parking waiver Add subsections a & b to 
Section 18.38.040.E.1 

Limited waiver for specified 
transit stops (15 minute 
headways), historic districts 
(State Register), & car share as 
defined 

Utility fees Subsection J added to 
Section 18.38.040 

Does not directly affect City; 
may not apply to private water 
purveyors 

Setback 
limitations 

Subsection 5 added to 
Section 18.38.040.C 

 

Fire sprinklers Subsection I added to 
Section 18.38.040 

 

Seniors, disabled 
& caregivers 

Subsection 5 added to 
Section 18.38.030.D 

Adds to eligible residents 
seniors (over 62), caregivers 
serving property and disabled. 
[NOTE: Previous eligible 
residents are family member 
and persons of low or very low 
income.] [NOTE: Affordable 
covenant still required.] 

 
In addition to the foregoing ADU bills there was a related bill (copy attached) 
passed by the legislature.  AB 2406 (Thurmond) provides that cities may adopt 
ordinances allowing Junior Accessory Dwelling Units (JADUs). It is however not 
mandatory. A JADU is a unit established within the walls of an existing residence 
with the following characteristics: 
 

 May have a separate entry from the main residence. 
 May have an efficiency kitchen with maximum waste line from sink 

of 1.5 inches, a cooking facility not greater than 120 volts (or gas), 
and a food preparation area and storage cabinets of reasonable 
size. 

 No parking can be required. 
 No fire sprinklers can be required. 
 No additional utility connection fees. 

 
Since this is volitional on the City’s part, there is no recommendation to proceed 
with a JADU ordinance. 

 
CONCLUSIONS 
Various changes are proposed primarily to address changes in State law relating 
to ADUs. The City also proposes to consider expanding eligible residents 
consistent with the adopted Housing Element Objective. 
 
 
 



MCTA
Novem

REC
Staff
Reso
 
 
Resp

 
Larry
Assis
 
Attac
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

A 16-01       
mber 17, 201

COMMENDA
f recommen
olution. 

pectfully Su

y Stevens, 
stant City M

chments: 

  
  
  

 

6 

ATION 
nds approva

ubmitted, 

 

Manager for

Appen
Resol
Exhibi
Exhibi
Exhibi

al of MCTA

r Communit

ndix A - 
ution PC-15
it A - SB 10
it B - AB 22
it C - AB 24

A 16-01 as s

ty Developm

General In
570 

069 Wiecko
299 Bloom
406 Thurmo

set forth in 

ment 

nformation

owski 

ond 

the attache

Page  

ed 

4



MCTA 16-01       Page  
November 17, 2016 

5

   
 

APPENDIX A 
 

GENERAL INFORMATION 
 
 
Applicant:   City of San Dimas 
 
Owner:   n/a 
 
Location:   City wide 
  
General Plan:  n/a  
 
 
 
Legal Notice: A legal notice was published in the Inland Valley Daily 

Bulletin and posted at City Hall, the Library, Post 
Office and Via Verde Shopping Center; on November 
4, 2016. 

 
Environmental: The project is Exempt per CEQA Guidelines Section 

15061(b)(3) – The activity will not result in a direct or 
reasonably foreseeable indirect physical change in 
the environment 

 



































































RESOLUTION 2016-59 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, CASTING ITS VOTE(S) FOR
COUNCILMEMBER TO REPRESENT CITIES WITHOUT

  PRESCRIPTIVE PUMPING RIGHTS ON THE BOARD OF THE 
SAN GABRIEL BASIN WATER QUALITY AUTHORITY

WHEREAS, on September 22, 1992, Senate Bill 1679 was signed into law by Governor 
Pete Wilson authorizing the creation of the San Gabriel Basin Water Quality Authority; and

WHEREAS, the Board of the San Gabriel Basin Water Quality Authority is composed of 
seven members with three appointed members from each of the three municipal water districts, 
one elected city council person from cities in the San Gabriel Basin with prescriptive pumping 
rights, and one elected city council person from cities in the San Gabriel Basin without 
prescriptive pumping rights, and two appointed members representing water producers; and

WHEREAS, the City of San Dimas is one of the cities in the San Gabriel Basin without 
prescriptive pumping rights;

WHEREAS, the City of San Dimas may cast its vote(s) for a representative by resolution
and delivered to the San Gabriel Basin Water Quality Authority no later than January 17, 2014 at 
12:00 p.m.

NOW THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS,
CALIFORNIA DOES HEREBY FIND, DETERMINE AND RESOLVE AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The City Council of the City of San Dimas casts its full vote(s) for 
Councilmember  Margaret Clerk as the representative for cities in the San Gabriel Basin without 
prescriptive pumping rights.

PASS, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this day of ,
20 . 

____________________________________
Curtis W. Morris, Mayor City of San Dimas

ATTEST:

_______________________________
Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk

5a



Resolution 2016-59                                                                                               Page 2 
Water Quality Control Board Vote  
 

 
 
 
I, Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk, hereby certify that Resolution 2016-59 was adopted 

by the City Council of San Dimas at its regular meeting of   XX, XXX by the following vote: 
  
AYES: 
NOES: 
ABSENT: 
ABSTAIN: 
 
 
      ______________________________  
          Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk 

 



 
 

 

 
 

Agenda Item Staff Report 

 
 
To: Honorable Mayor and Members of City Council  
 For the meeting of December 13, 2016 
 
From: Blaine Michaelis, City Manager 
 
Initiated by:  Mark W. Steres, City Attorney 
 
Subject: Introduce Ordinance 1252 an Ordinance by the City Council of the City 

of San Dimas, California, Repealing and Replacing San Dimas Municipal 
Code Chapter 8.40 of Title 8 Regarding Residency Restrictions of 
Registered Sex Offenders 

______________________________________________________________________ 
  

 
BACKGROUND 
 
On November 7, 2006, the voters of the State of California overwhelmingly approved 
Proposition 83, the “Sexual Predator Punishment and Control Act,” commonly known as 
“Jessica’s Law,” so as to better protect Californians, and, in particular, to protect the 
State’s children from sex offenders.  Proposition 83, codified as California Penal Code 
section 3003.5, prohibits any person who is required to register as a sex offender per 
California Penal Code sections 290 et seq. from residing within 2,000 feet of a public or 
private school or any park where children regularly gather (Cal. Penal Code § 
3003.5(b)).  In addition, Section 3003.5 expressly authorizes local regulation of sex 
offender residency restrictions (Cal. Penal Code § 3003.5(c)). 
The City of San Dimas, like many other cities in the State of California, took up the 
State’s invitation and, in reliance of the authority set forth in California Penal Code 
subsection 3003.5(c), the City adopted Ordinance 1186, adding Chapter 8.40 to the San 
Dimas Municipal Code , entitled “Sex Offender Residency Restrictions” (the 
“Ordinance”). 
 
The City’s Ordinance currently prohibits a sex offender from: (i) residing within 2,000 
feet of a public or private school grade K through 12, or park; (ii) residing 1,000 feet of a 
child care center; (iii) residing 1,000 feet of another sex offender’s residency, including 
hotels, motels, or mobile home parks (iv) residing in a multi-unit development (e.g. 
apartment building, mobilehome park, etc) “if any separate dwelling unit within the 

5b



multiple dwelling is already occupied by a sex offender”; or (iii) residing in any guest 
room of a hotel or motel “if any separate guest room within the hotel or motel is already 
occupied by a sex offender”. 
 
The City’s Ordinance defines sex offenders as “any person for whom registration is 
required pursuant to Section 290 of the California Penal Code, regardless of whether 
that person is on parole or probation”. 
 
On March 2, 2015, the California Supreme Court issued its decision in the case of In re 
Taylor, (2015) 60 Cal. 4th 1019, which addressed the validity of the 2,000 foot residency 
restriction for sex offender parolees under Section 3003.5(b) of the Penal Code.  The 
Supreme Court in In re Taylor ruled that blanket enforcement of section 3003.5 “as 
applied” in San Diego County was unconstitutional because (1) it deprived offenders of 
access to necessary services such as medical care, psychological treatment, and 
residential drug and alcohol counseling, (2) it excluded a vast majority of reasonably 
available affordable housing, threatening a dramatic increase in homeless and transient 
sex offenders, and (3) such increases in homelessness undermined monitoring efforts, 
and demonstrated that the regulations had no rational relationship to the government’s 
goals of protecting the public and the State’s children from sex offenders. 
 
Most recently, on August 4, 2016, the Court of Appeal decided People v. Lynch (2016) 2 
Cal.App.5th 524, which interpreted Penal Code section 3003.5 narrowly to apply only to 
parolees. 
 
LEGAL CHALLENGES SINCE SUPREME COURT DECISION 
 
Since the Supreme Court decision in In re Taylor, an attorney has been actively filing 
lawsuits against cities challenging the city’s local residency distance restrictions 
adopted pursuant to Penal Code section 3003.5.  The attorney has filed and served a 
total of 14 lawsuits challenging residency restrictions in 14 cities.   Of that total, eight 
cases have settled in which five cities repealed (Grover Beach, Arcadia, Norwalk, Apple 
Valley and Tustin) and three cities (Gardena, Bell Gardens and Long Beach) 
significantly revised their ordinances.   The remaining six cases were filed in August or 
later and have not yet been settled.  One city, City of Murrieta, decided not to settle, but 
chose to fight the legal challenge to its local residency restrictions. 
   
The plaintiff’s attorney in the Murrieta case requested that the court issue a Temporary 
Restraining Order (TRO) and then filed a motion for a Preliminary Injunction against the 
enforcement of the city’s residency restrictions.  The trial court granted the TRO; and 
later, after reading the written briefs and hearing oral argument from both sides, issued 
a Preliminary Injunction against Murrieta enforcing its local residency restrictions.  That 
case is still in litigation and pending the trial. 
 



On November 15, 2016, the City of San Dimas was served with a complaint filed in U.S. 
District Court.  The case, Frank Lindsay v. San Dimas, was filed by the same attorney 
and challenges San Dimas’ Chapter 8.40 local residency distance restrictions.   
 
RECOMMENDATION 
 
The proposed San Dimas Ordinance, attached, amends the San Dimas Municipal 
Code, Chapter 8.40, in a similar fashion as the three cities above (Gardena, Bell 
Gardens and Long Beach) that revised their ordinances following legal challenges to its 
local residency distance restrictions.  The attorney for Frank Lindsay has indicated that, 
as with the other three cities, she will not object to the proposed revisions and that 
adoption of the proposed Ordinance will resolve the litigation. 

The proposed Ordinance repeals all of the local distance restrictions challenged in the 
lawsuit but maintains the restriction that not more than one sex offender may reside 
within a dwelling unit of a single-family home, mobile home or a multi-family 
development, or within a guest room of a hotel or motel, unless those persons are 
legally related by blood, marriage or adoption.  The proposed Ordinance also limits to a 
maximum of ten percent (10%) the number of dwelling units in which a sex offender 
may reside within a multi-family development or mobile home park development or 
within guest rooms in a hotel or motel.   

Based upon all of the above, the City Attorney’s office recommends that the City 
Council do as follows: 

1. Waive further reading and introduce Ordinance 1252 entitled: 

AN ORDINANCE BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS, 
CALIFORNIA, REPEALING AND REPLACING SAN DIMAS MUNICIPAL 
CODE CHAPTER 8.40 OF TITLE 8 REGARDING RESIDENCY 
RESTRICTIONS OF REGISTERED SEX OFFENDERS 

 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
Mark W. Steres 
City Attorney 
 
 
Attachments: 
Ordinance 1251 



ORDINANCE 1252 
 
AN ORDINANCE BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS, 
CALIFORNIA, REPEALING AND REPLACING SAN DIMAS MUNICIPAL CODE 
CHAPTER 8.40 OF TITLE 8 REGARDING RESIDENCY RESTRICTIONS OF 
REGISTERED SEX OFFENDERS 
 

WHEREAS, on November 7, 2006, the voters of the State of California overwhelmingly 
approved Proposition 83, the “Sexual Predator Punishment and Control Act,” commonly known as 
“Jessica’s Law,” so as to better protect Californians, and, in particular, to protect the State’s children 
from sex offenders; and 

  
WHEREAS, Proposition 83, codified as California Penal Code section 3003.5, prohibits any 

person who is required to register as a sex offender per California Penal Code sections 290 et seq. 
from residing within 2,000 feet of a public or private school or any park where children regularly 
gather (Cal. Penal Code § 3003.5(b)); and  
 

WHEREAS, Section 3003.5 expressly authorizes local regulation of sex offender residency 
(Cal. Penal Code § 3003.5(c)); and 
 

WHEREAS, in reliance on the authority set forth in California Penal Code 
subsection 3003.5(c) and its police power, the City of San Dimas, like many other cities in the State 
of California, adopted Ordinance 1186, adding Chapter 8.40 to the San Dimas Municipal Code , 
entitled “Sex Offender Residency Restrictions” (the “Ordinance”); and 
 

WHEREAS, the Ordinance currently prohibits a sex offender from: (i) residing within 2,000 
feet of a public or private school grade K through 12, or park; (ii) residing 1,000 feet of a child care 
center; (iii) residing 1,000 feet of another sex offender’s residency, including hotels, motels, or 
mobile home parks (iv) residing in a multi-unit development (e.g. apartment building, mobilehome 
park, etc) “if any separate dwelling unit within the multiple dwelling is already occupied by a sex 
offender”; or (iii) residing in any guest room of a hotel or motel “if any separate guest room within 
the hotel or motel is already occupied by a sex offender.” These restrictions may be referred to 
collectively as the “Residency Restrictions”); and 
 

WHEREAS, the Ordinance currently provides that its restrictions apply to sex offenders, 
defined as “any person for whom registration is required pursuant to Section 290 of the California 
Penal Code, regardless of whether that person is on parole or probation”; and 
 

WHEREAS, on March 2, 2015, the California Supreme Court issued its decision in the case 
of In re Taylor, (2015) 60 Cal. 4th 1019, which addressed the validity of the 2,000 foot residency 
restriction for sex offender parolees under Section 3003.5(b) of the Penal Code; and  
 

WHEREAS, the In re Taylor court ruled that blanket enforcement of section 3003.5 “as 
applied” in San Diego County was unconstitutional because (1) it deprived offenders of access to 
necessary services such as medical care, psychological treatment, and residential drug and alcohol 
counseling, (2) it excluded a vast majority of reasonably available affordable housing, threatening a 



Ordinance 1252                                                                                                            Page 2 
SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions 
Sex Offenders 
 

  

dramatic increase in homeless and transient sex offenders, and (3) such increases in homelessness 
undermined monitoring efforts, and demonstrated that the regulations had no rational relationship to 
the government’s goals of protecting the public and the State’s children from sex offenders; and 
 

WHEREAS, most recently, on August 4, 2016, the Court of Appeal decided People v. Lynch 
(2016) 2 Cal.App.5th 524, which interpreted Penal Code section 3003.5 narrowly to apply only to 
parolees; and  
 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the recent court decisions bring into question the 
City’s authority to enforce blanket residency distance restrictions; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the proposed amendments to Chapter 8.40 will 
strike the appropriate balance between the concerns expressed in the court decisions, and the 
protection of the public. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, the CITY COUNCIL of the CITY OF SAN DIMAS, CALIFORNIA, does 
ordain as follows: 
 

SECTION 1.  The forgoing recitals are true and correct and incorporated herein by this 
reference. 
 

SECTION 2.  Chapter 8.40 (Sex Offender Residency Restrictions) of Title 8 (Health and 
Safety) of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby repealed and replaced with the following: 
 
8.40.010 Definitions 
For the purpose of this chapter, the following definitions shall apply unless the context clearly 
indicates or requires a different meaning. 
 
    A.   “Hotel” or “motel” shall have those meanings as set forth in Chapter 18.08 of this Municipal 
Code. 
     
B.  “Mobile home” means a structure designed for human habitation and for being moved on a street 
or highway under permit pursuant to Section 35790 of the Vehicle Code. Mobile home includes a 
manufactured home, as defined in Section 18007 of the Health and Safety Code, and a mobile home, 
as defined in Section 18008 of the Health and Safety Code, but does not include a recreational 
vehicle, as defined in Section 799.29 of the Civil Code and Section 18010 of the Health and Safety 
Code or a commercial coach as defined in Section 18001.18 of the Health and Safety Code. Mobile 
home does not include a trailer or other recreational vehicle located in a recreational vehicle park. 
     
C.   “Mobile home park” means a residential land use where two or more mobile and/or 
manufactured home sites are rented, or held out for rent, to accommodate mobile and/or 
manufactured homes designed for permanent residency, with such homes not affixed to a permanent 
foundation. 
     



Ordinance 1252                                                                                                            Page 2 
SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions 
Sex Offenders 
 

  

D.   “Multiple dwelling” means any building designed and used as a residence for 3 or more families 
living independently of each other. This includes apartment houses and condominiums, but does not 
include hotels or motels. 
 E.  “Owner’s authorized agent” means any natural person, firm, association, joint venture, joint 
stock company, partnership, organization, club, company, corporation, business trust or the manager, 
lessee, agent, servant, office or employee authorized to act for the owner for a property. 
    
 F.    “Permanent resident” means any person who, as of a given date, obtained the right to occupy a 
dwelling including but not limited to a single-family dwelling, multiple dwelling, two-family 
dwelling, hotel, motel or mobile home for more than thirty consecutive days. 
     
G.    “Property owner” as applied to buildings and land means the owner of record of any parcel or 
real property as designated on the county assessor’s tax roll, or a holder of a subsequently recorded 
deed to the property, and shall include any part owner, joint owner, tenant, tenant in common, or 
joint tenant, of the whole or part of such a building or land. 
    
 H.   “Responsible party” means the property owner and/or owner’s authorized agent. 
    
 I.  “Sex offender” means any person for whom registration is required pursuant to Section 290 of the 
California Penal Code, regardless of whether that person is on parole or probation. 
    
 J.  “Single-family dwelling” means any detached, semi-attached, or attached building designed and 
used as a residence for one family. 
    
 K.  “Temporary resident” means any person who, for a period of thirty days or less, obtained the 
right to occupy a dwelling including, but not limited to, a hotel or motel. 
     
L.   “Two-family dwelling” means a building designed and used as a residence for two families 
living independently of each other. This includes duplexes.  
 
8.40.020 Sex offender violation – One family dwellings 
No sex offender shall be a permanent or temporary resident in a one-family dwelling already 
occupied by another sex offender, unless those persons are legally related by blood, marriage or 
adoption.  
 
8.40.030 Sex offender violation – Two family dwellings 
No sex offender shall be a permanent or temporary resident in a two-family dwelling already 
occupied by another sex offender, unless those persons are legally related by blood, marriage or 
adoption. 
 
8.40.040 Sex offender violation – Multiple dwellings 
No sex offender shall be a permanent or temporary resident in the same dwelling unit of a multiple 
dwelling already occupied by another sex offender, unless those persons are legally related by blood, 
marriage or adoption. 
 



Ordinance 1252                                                                                                            Page 2 
SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions 
Sex Offenders 
 

  

8.40.050 Sex offender violation – Multiple dwellings – Permanent Resident 
No sex offender shall be a permanent or temporary resident in a multiple dwelling if ten percent of 
the total dwelling units within the multiple dwelling are already occupied by sex offenders 
(“occupied units”). Where this calculation results in a fractional number of occupied units that is 
below the halfway breakpoint (less than 0.5), the number of permissible occupied units will be 
rounded downward. Where it results in a fractional number of occupied units that is at or above the 
halfway breakpoint (greater than or equal to 0.5), the number of permissible occupied units will be 
rounded upward. Notwithstanding the above, a sex offender may be a permanent or temporary 
resident of an occupied unit within a multiple dwelling, without violating the restrictions contained 
herein, if the occupied unit is occupied by another sex offender legally related to the sex offender by 
blood, marriage or adoption. 
 
8.40.060 Sex offender violation – Hotel/motel/rooms 
No sex offender shall be a permanent or temporary resident in the same guest room of a hotel or 
motel, already occupied by another sex offender, unless those persons are legally related by blood, 
marriage or adoption. 
 
8.40.070 Sex offender violation – Hotel/motel – Permanent resident 
No sex offender shall be a permanent resident in any guest room of a hotel or motel, if ten percent of 
the total guest rooms within the hotel or motel are already occupied by sex offenders (“occupied 
units”). Where this calculation results in a fractional number of occupied units that is below the 
halfway breakpoint (less than 0.5), the number of permissible occupied units will be rounded 
downward. Where it results in a fractional number of occupied units that is at or above the halfway 
breakpoint (greater than or equal to 0.5), the number of permissible occupied units will be rounded 
upward. Notwithstanding the above, a sex offender may be a permanent or temporary resident of an 
occupied unit within a hotel or motel, without violating the restrictions contained herein, if the 
occupied unit is occupied by another sex offender legally related by blood, marriage or adoption to 
the sex offender.  
 
8.40.080 Sex offender violation – Mobile home dwelling 
 No sex offender shall be a permanent or temporary resident in any mobile home sited in and upon a 
rented space located within a mobile home park wherein the mobile home is already occupied by a 
sex offender, unless those persons are legally related by blood, marriage or adoption. 
 
8.40.090 Sex offender violation – Mobile home dwelling – Permanent resident 
No sex offender shall be a permanent or temporary resident in any mobile home sited in and upon a 
rented space located within a mobile home park, if ten percent of the total mobile homes within the 
mobile home park are already occupied by sex offenders (“occupied units”). Where this calculation 
results in a fractional number of occupied units that is below the halfway breakpoint (less than 0.5), 
the number of permissible occupied units will be rounded downward. Where it results in a fractional 
number of occupied units that is at or above the halfway breakpoint (greater than or equal to 0.5), the 
number of permissible occupied units will be rounded upward. Notwithstanding the above, a sex 
offender may be a permanent or temporary resident of an occupied unit within a mobile home park, 
without violating the restrictions contained herein, if the occupied unit is occupied by another sex 
offender legally related by blood, marriage or adoption to the sex offender. 



Ordinance 1252                                                                                                            Page 2 
SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions 
Sex Offenders 
 

  

 
8.40.100 Responsible party violation—One-family dwellings. 
No responsible party shall knowingly rent a one-family dwelling to, or allow occupancy, as a 
permanent or temporary resident, by more than one sex offender during any given period of tenancy, 
unless those persons are legally related by blood, marriage or adoption.  
 
8.40.110 Responsible party violation—Two-family dwellings. 
No responsible party shall knowingly rent a unit within a two-family dwelling to, or allow 
occupancy, as a permanent or temporary resident, by more than one sex offender during any given 
period of tenancy, unless those persons are legally related by blood, marriage or adoption.  
 
8.40.120 Responsible party violation—Multiple dwellings. No responsible party shall knowingly 
rent a unit within a multiple dwelling to, or allow occupancy, as a permanent or temporary resident, 
by more than one sex offender during any given period of tenancy, unless those persons are legally 
related by blood, marriage or adoption.   
 
8.40.130 Responsible party violation—Multiple dwellings – Multiple Units 
No responsible party shall knowingly rent more than ten percent of the total dwelling units within a 
multiple dwelling to, or allow occupancy as a permanent or temporary resident by, a sex offender 
during any given period of tenancy (“occupied units”). Where this calculation results in a fractional 
number of occupied units that is below the halfway breakpoint (less than 0.5), the number of 
permissible occupied units will be rounded downward. Where it results in a fractional number of 
occupied units that is at or above the halfway breakpoint (greater than or equal to 0.5), the number of 
permissible occupied units will be rounded upward.  
 
8.40.140 Responsible party violation—Hotel/motel. 
No responsible party shall knowingly rent a guest room in a hotel or motel to, or allow occupancy, as 
a permanent or temporary resident, by more than one sex offender, unless those persons are legally 
related by blood, marriage or adoption.  
 
8.40.150 Responsible party violation—Hotel/motel—Multiple rooms. 
No responsible party shall knowingly rent more than ten percent of the total guest rooms in a hotel or 
motel to, or allow occupancy as a permanent or temporary resident by, a sex offender (“occupied 
units”). Where this calculation results in a fractional number of occupied units that is below the 
halfway breakpoint (less than 0.5), the number of permissible occupied units will be rounded 
downward. Where it results in a fractional number of occupied units that is at or above the halfway 
breakpoint (greater than or equal to 0.5), the number of permissible occupied units will be rounded 
upward. 
 
8.40.160 Responsible party violation—Mobile home dwelling. 
No responsible party shall knowingly rent a space for the location and placement of a mobile home, 
or allow occupancy as a permanent or temporary resident, by more than one sex offender during any 
given period of tenancy, unless those persons are legally related by blood, marriage, or adoption. 
 
8.40.170 Responsible party violation—Mobile home park—Multiple spaces. 

http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_110&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_120&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_140&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_160&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_170&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_180&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_190&frames=on


Ordinance 1252                                                                                                            Page 2 
SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions 
Sex Offenders 
 

  

No responsible party shall knowingly rent more than ten percent of the total spaces for the location 
and placement of a mobile home to, or allow occupancy as a permanent or temporary resident by, a 
sex offender (“occupied units”). Where this calculation results in a fractional number of occupied 
units that is below the halfway breakpoint (less than 0.5), the number of permissible occupied units 
will be rounded downward. Where it results in a fractional number of occupied units that is at or 
above the halfway breakpoint (greater than or equal to 0.5), the number of permissible occupied 
units will be rounded upward. 
 
8.40.180 Offenses constituting nuisances.  Any two-family dwelling, hotel, motel, multiple dwelling, 
or one-family dwelling operated or maintained in a manner inconsistent with the occupancy 
requirements of this chapter are declared to be unlawful and are defined as and declared to be public 
nuisances per se that are injurious to the public health, safety, and welfare. 
 
8.40.190 Nuisances—Recovery of abatement expenses. 
A.  In any civil action or proceeding, administrative proceeding, or special proceeding, including, but 
not limited to, those brought to abate a public nuisance, the prevailing party will be entitled to 
recovery of all staff time costs, costs of abatement, attorney’s fees and expenses, provided that 
attorneys’ fees will only be available in those actions or proceedings in which the city has provided 
notice at the commencement of such action or proceeding that it intends to seek and recover its own 
attorneys’ fees. In no action or proceeding will an award of attorneys’ fees exceed the amount of 
reasonable attorneys’ fees incurred by the city in the action or proceeding. 
     
B.   Moneys due the city pursuant to this chapter may be recovered in an appropriate civil action. 
Alternatively, such liability may be enforced by special assessment proceedings against the parcel of 
land upon which the nuisance existed, which proceedings must be conducted in a manner 
substantively similar to proceedings prescribed in Chapter 8.16 of this Municipal Code relating to 
assessment for abatement of property nuisances. 
 
8.40.200 Penalties. 
Every person who violates any provision of this chapter shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and shall 
be subject to the penalties as set forth in Chapter 1.12 of this Municipal Code. Each day that such 
violation exists shall be deemed a new and separate offense.  
 
8.40.210 Criminal penalties do not satisfy administrative civil actions. 
Neither the arrest, prosecution, conviction, imprisonment, nor payment of any fine for the violation 
of this chapter shall satisfy or diminish the authority of the city to institute administrative or civil 
actions seeking enforcement of any or all of the provisions of this chapter.  
 
8.40.220 Timing of application of this chapter. 
Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained herein, this chapter shall apply to all sex 
offenders who establish a new residence within the city of San Dimas after the effective date of the 
ordinance codified in this chapter, and to all responsible parties who allow occupancy by a sex 
offender within the city of San Dimas after the effective date of this chapter. Nothing in this chapter 
is intended to limit the obligations of a sex offender to comply with the requirements of state law, 
including, but not limited to, California Penal Code Section 3003.5.  

http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_200&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_210&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_220&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_230&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/sandimas/view.php?topic=8-8_40-8_40_240&frames=on


Ordinance 1252                                                                                                            Page 2 
SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions 
Sex Offenders 
 

  

 
SECTION 3. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this Ordinance is, for 
any reason, held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent 
jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance.  
The City Council of the City of San Dimas hereby declares that it would have adopted this 
Ordinance and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof, irrespective of 
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses, phrases, or portions thereof 
may be declared invalid or unconstitutional. 
  
SECTION 4.  This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect thirty (30) days after its second 
reading and adoption. 
 
SECTION 5.  This Ordinance shall not apply to sex offenders who have established residence in 
violation of the Residency Restrictions of Title 8, Chapter 8.40 of the San Dimas Municipal Code 
prior to the effective date of this Ordinance.  Any sex offender who changes residence after the 
effective date of this Ordinance must move to a residence whose location is in compliance with the 
Residency Restrictions. 
  
SECTION 6.  The City Clerk shall certify to the passage and adoption of this Ordinance by the City 
Council of the city of San Dimas and shall cause a summary of this ordinance to be published in 
accordance with Government Code § 36933. 
 

 

PASSED, APPROVED and ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the City Council on this 

_________ day of January, 2017.  

  

 
____________________________________ 
Curtis W. Morris, Mayor City of San Dimas 

 
 
 
 
ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
_______________________________        ______________________________________ 
Debra Black Assistant City Clerk                       Mark W. Steres City Attorney 
 
 
 

 
 



Ordinance 1252                                                                                                            Page 2 
SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions 
Sex Offenders 
 

  

 
 
I, DEBRA BLACK, ASSISTANT CITY CLERK of the City of San Dimas, do hereby 

certify that Ordinance 1252 was introduced at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City 
of San Dimas on the XX day of XXXX, and thereafter passed, approved and adopted at a regular 
meeting of said City Council held on the XX, day of XXXX, by the following vote: 
 
AYES:  
NOES:  
ABSENT:  
ABSTAIN:  
 

                                     ________________________________ 
                                                                      Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk 



 

 
 

Agenda Item Staff Report 

 
 
To: Honorable Mayor and Members of City Council  
 For the meeting of December 13, 2016 
 
From: Blaine Michaelis, City Manager 
 
Initiated by:  Eric M. Beilstein, Building & Safety Division 
 
Subject: ORDINANCE 1250, AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF 

THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS AMENDING SPECIFIED CHAPTERS OF 
TITLE 15 OF THE SAN DIMAS MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING 
BY REFERENCE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
BUILDING CODE, VOLUMES 1 & 2, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, AND THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, TOGETHER 
WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND 
EXCEPTIONS, INCLUDING FEES AND PENALTIES 

______________________________________________________________________  
  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
SUMMARY 

Amend Title 15 of the San Dimas Municipal Code 
(Buildings and Construction) by adopting by 
reference the 2016 Editions of the California Model 
Codes to regulate the construction, alteration, and 
occupancy of all buildings or structures in the City of 
San Dimas and be consistent with the California 
Health and Safety Code.  

 
 

5c



Building Code adoption  Page 2 
December 13th, 2016 

BACKGROUND 
 
The California Health and Safety Code establishes a Building Standards Commission, whose 
duties include approval, codification, and publication of building standards in a triennial edition 
of the California Building Standards Code, commonly called Title 24 and also establishes a date 
that these codes become effective throughout the State. The effective date for this triennial 
edition is January 1, 2017. 
 
The adoption of these codes would regulate the fabrication, construction, enlargement, alteration, 
repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, or 
other improvements to real property; maintenance of all buildings or structures in the City of San 
Dimas; and provision for issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore. 
 
The Building Standards Code does not include the adoption of procedural ordinances by a City 
or other agency related to civil, administrative, or criminal procedures and remedies available for 
enforcing code violations. 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
 
Introduce Ordinance 1250 and Set for Public Hearing on January 10, 2017 to adopt by reference 
the 2016 editions of the California model codes with various additions, deletions and additional 
administrative provisions. 
 
 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
Eric M. Beilstein, Supt. of Bldg & Safety 
 
 
Attachments: 
Ordinance 1250 
 
 
 
 
 
 



ORDINANCE 1250 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN DIMAS 
AMENDING SPECIFIED CHAPTERS OF TITLE 15 OF THE SAN DIMAS 
MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE, THE 2016 EDITION 
OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, VOLUMES 1 & 2, THE 2016 
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION 
OF THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2016 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, AND THE 2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA 
GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN 
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS, INCLUDING 
FEES AND PENALTIES 

WHEREAS, the California Health and Safety Code establishes a Building 
Standards Commission, whose duties include approval, codification, and publication of 
building standards in a triennial edition of the California Building Standards Code, 
commonly called Title 24; and 

WHEREAS, the Building Standards Commission also establishes a date that 
these codes become effective throughout the State; and 

WHEREAS, the effective date for this triennial edition is January 1, 2017; and 

WHEREAS, the adoption of these codes would regulate the fabrication, 
construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, 
occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, or other improvements to real property; 
maintenance of all buildings or structures in the City of San Dimas; and provision for 
issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and 

WHEREAS, the Building Standards Code does not include the adoption of 
procedural ordinances by a City or other agency related to civil, administrative, or 
criminal procedures and remedies available for enforcing code violations. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN 
DIMAS DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

All references to a prior code shall mean to apply to the corresponding provisions of 
the newly adopted code. 

Section 15.02.010 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby repealed and replaced in 
its entirety as follows: 

 15.02.010 Uniform Administrative Code Except as otherwise amended in this 
chapter, Chapter 1, Division II of the 2016 California Building Code is adopted as the 
San Dimas Administrative Code and may be cited as such.  



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 2

15.02.020 Amendments. 

The following amendments are made to the San Dimas administrative code:

Section [A] 101.4 Referenced Standards is amended to read as follows:

“The other codes listed in Section 101.4.1 through 101.4.6 and referenced 
elsewhere in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this 
code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. All references to a
specific code shall be deemed to refer to the lastest adopted San Dimas codes 
and standards.”

Section [A] 113.3 Qualifications, is amended to read as follows:

“In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations 
made by the Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of 
the technical code, there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals 
consisting of the members of the Development Plan Review Board. The 
building official shall be an ex officio member and shall act as secretary to 
said board but shall have no vote upon any matter before the board. The Board 
of Appeals shall be appointed by the governing body and shall hold office at 
its pleasure. The board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its 
business an shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant 
with a duplicate copy to the building official.”

Section [A] 114.1 Unlawful Acts, is amended to read as follows:

“No person, firm or corporation, whether as owner, lessee, sublessee or 
occupant, shall erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, 
demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or premises, or cause or 
permit the same to be done contrary to or in violation of any of the provisions 
of said code or any order issued by the board of appeals or building official 
thereunder. Any person violating the provisions of this section is guilty of a 
misdemeanor or an infraction for each day such violation continues.”

Section [A] 105.2 Work exempt from permit is amended by deleting 
subsection (12) window awnings.

Section [A] 105.4 Validity of permit is amended by adding the statement as 
follows:

“No building permit may be issued for any development unless the proposed 
construction is consistent with the GENERAL PLAN OF THE CITY OF SAN 
DIMAS.”



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 3

Section 304.2, Permit Fees, is amended to read as follows:

“Building permit fees shall be paid in the amount fixed from time to time by 
the City Council by resolution. The determination of value or valuation under 
any of the provisions of this code shall be made by the building official. The 
value to be used in computing the building permit and plan review fees shall 
be the total value of all construction work for which the permit is issued as 
well as all finish work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air-
conditioning, elevators, fire extinguishing systems and any other permanent 
equipment.”

Section 304.3, Plan Review Fees, is amended to read as follows:

“When a plan or other data are required to be submitted by Subsection (b) of 
Section 302, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans 
and specifications for review. The plan review fee shall be in the amount fixed 
from time to time by the City Council by resolution. When plans are 
incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, an additional 
plan review fee shall be paid.”

Section 304.5.2, Fee is hereby amended to read:

“An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether 
or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be 
equal to the amount of the permit fee required. The payment of such 
investigation fee shall not exempt the applicant from compliance with all 
other provisions of either this code or the technical codes nor from the penalty 
prescribed by law”.

Chapter 3, Fee Tables 3-A through 3-H are hereby deleted.

Section 15.04.010 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby repealed and replaced in 
its entirety as follows:

15.04.010  Adoption.
Except as provided in this Chapter, those certain building codes known and 
designated as the California Building Code, 2016 Edition, Volumes 1 and 2,
including Appendix Chapters "C," Agricultural Buildings "F,"Rodentproofing "I," 
Patio Covers and "J," Grading based on the 2015 International Building Code as 
published by the International Code Council, shall be and become the Building
Codes of the City of San Dimas for regulating the construction, alteration, 
movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, 
location, maintenance, removal and demolition of every buildings and/or 
structures or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or 
structures throughout the City.  The California Building Code and its appendix 
chapters will be on file for public examination in the office of the Building 
Official.



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 4

Section 15.04.020 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby amended as follows:

15.04.020  Amendments and additions
The following section of the California Building Code (CBC) Chapter 1, "Scope 
and Administration, Division I, California Administration," is amended as 
follows:

1.8.8 Appeals Board. Subsection 1.8.8 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

The following portions and sections of "Chapter 1, Scope and Administration, 
Division II, Scope and Administration" are hereby amended as follows:

The following language shall be added to Subsection 101.2 "Scope":

In order to properly maintain and safeguard healthful living conditions and 
comply with all provisions of the Building Codes, it is hereby declared 
unlawful to use any streetcars, boxcars, house cars, motor bus bodies, or 
similar means of conveyance or structures of similar nature of 
construction, for places of habitation, residence, or place of business in 
this City. However, nothing contained herein shall prohibit the use of any 
house trailer or mobile home for places of abode or habitation in an 
approved mobile home park, providing such structures comply with all 
other conditions and requirements of this Code.

The following language shall be added to Subsection 102.1 "General":

If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause, or 
phrase of this Code or any part thereof is in conflict with the Fire Code, 
the most restrictive shall be applicable.

Subsection 105.2 "Work exempt from permit" is hereby amended as follows:

Item 02 (Fences) under "Building" is hereby amended to read “Fences not
over 6 feet high”.

Item 04 (Retaining walls) under “Building” is hereby amended to read “ 
Retaining walls

Item 10 (Shade cloth structures) under "Building" is hereby deleted in its 
entirety.

Item 12 (Window awnings) under "Building" is hereby deleted in its 
entirety.



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 5

Subsection 105.3.2 "Time limitation of application" is hereby adopted and 
amended to read as follows:

Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days following the 
date of application shall expire by limitation. Plans and other data 
submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or 
destroyed by the Building Official. The Building Official may extend the 
time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days on 
written request by the applicant showing the circumstances beyond the 
control of the applicant having prevented action from being taken. An 
application shall not be extended more than once. An application shall not 
be extended if this Code or any other pertinent laws or ordinances have 
been amended subsequent to the date of application. In order to renew 
action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans 
and pay a new plan review fee. All plans submitted for review prior to the 
effective date of this Ordinance shall expire by limitation within 180 days 
of application with no extensions.

Subsection 105.5 "Expiration" is hereby adopted and amended to read as follows:

Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of the 
technical codes shall expire by limitation and become null and void, if the 
building or work authorized by such permit is not commenced within 180 
days from the date of such permit, or if the building or work authorized by 
such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is 
commenced for a period of 180 days. Before such work can be 
recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained to do so, and the fee 
therefore shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for such 
work, provided no changes have been made or will be made in the original 
plans and specifications for such work, and provided further, that such 
suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. In order to renew 
action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full 
permit fee.

A permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of 
the time within which work may commence under that permit when the 
permittee is unable to commence work within the time required by this 
Section for good and satisfactory reasons. The Building Official may 
extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not exceeding 180 
days upon written request by the permittee showing that circumstances 
beyond the control of the permittee have prevented action from being 
taken. Permits shall not be extended more than once.



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 6

Subsection 105.5.1 "Expiration of demolition permit” is hereby adopted and 
amended to read as follows:

A demolition permit shall expire by limitation and become null-and-void 
60 days after the date on which the permit was issued. The Building 
Official may extend the validity of the permit for a period not exceeding 
180 days beyond the initial 60 day limit upon written request by the 
applicant filed with the Building Official prior to the expiration date of the 
original permit.

Subsection 105.5.2 "Expiration of permit for legalizing unpermitted structures” is 
hereby adopted and amended to read as follows:

Notwithstanding any provision of Section 105.5, if a building permit was 
issued in order to bring an unpermitted structure or other unlawful, 
substandard, or hazardous condition into compliance with any applicable 
law, ordinance, rule or regulation, such permit shall expire by limitation 
and become null-and-void 90 days after the date on which the permit was 
issued. The Building Official may extend the validity of the permit for a 
period not exceeding 90 days beyond the initial 90 day limit upon written 
request filed with the Building Official prior to the expiration date of the 
original permit.

Subsection 107.5 "Retention of construction documents" is hereby amended by 
adding the following language:

Before final inspection, electronic images of all plans, engineering 
calculations, and records that are submitted for the purpose of obtaining a 
building permit shall be submitted at the request of the Building Official. 
Electronic images shall be based on the Building Division's Electronic 
Archiving Policy.

Section 109 "Fees" is hereby adopted and amended as follows:

Subsection 109.2 "Schedule of permit fees" is hereby amended by adding 
the following language:

When submittal documents are required by Section 302.2 of the Uniform 
Administrative Code, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of 
submitting the submittal documents for plan review. The plan review fee 
shall be 100 percent of the building, electrical, mechanical and plumbing 
work permit fee as required in accordance with the fee schedule 
established by resolution of the City Council. When the City retains a 
private entity or person to perform plan review, the plan review fee shall 
be in an amount sufficient to defray the cost of such services, but in no 



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 7

case shall the plan review fee be less than the amount specified in this 
Section.

Subsection 109.4 "Work commencing before permit issuance" is hereby deleted 
and replaced in its entirety as follows:

109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Whenever work for 
which a permit is required by this Code has been commenced without first 
obtaining a permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit 
may be issued for such work. An investigation fee, in addition to the 
permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or 
subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be as required, as in 
accordance with the schedule as established by the applicable governing 
authority. The minimum investigation fee shall be the same as the 
minimum fee set forth in accordance with the schedule as established by 
the applicable governing authority (double fee). The payment of such 
investigation fee shall not exempt an applicant from compliance with all 
other provisions of either this Code or the technical codes nor from the 
penalty prescribed by law.

Subsection 109.6 "Refunds" is hereby deleted and replaced in its entirety as 
follows:

109.6 Refunds. The Building Official may authorize up to 100 % 
refunding of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected.
The Building Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 
percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit 
issued in accordance with this Code. The Building Official may authorize 
refunding of not more than 80 percent of plan review fee has been paid 
when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid 
is withdrawn or cancelled before any examination time has been 
expanded. The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any 
fee paid except upon written request filed by the original permittee not 
later than 180 days after the date of payment.

Section 110 "Inspections" is adopted and amended by adding the following 
subsection:

110.1.1 Workmanship. It is the intention of the City that all construction 
carried on under the review of the Building Division is of good quality. 
The Building Official shall be empowered to enforce the installation of 
work that is straight, level, plumb, square, etc., as the situation requires. 
All work shall be well fit and of a durable nature. Paint in all cases shall 
not be below normal standard for the use applied. The proper grading of 
walks, drives, and yards shall be required when being installed with the 
work requiring a building permit. A minimum thickness of 3½ inches for 



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 8

flat concrete work and 2 inches for asphalt paving shall be required. All 
exterior flat concrete work shall include such breaks for expansion as 
deemed necessary by the Building Official.

Subsection 110.3.5 "Lath and gypsum board inspection" is hereby amended by 
deleting the "exception" in its entirety.

Subsection 110.3.8 "Other inspections" is hereby amended by adding the 
following language:

A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection 
when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete 
or when corrections called for are not made. This section is not to be 
interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for 
failure to comply with the requirements of the technical codes but as 
controlling the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready 
for such inspection or reinspection. To obtain a reinspection, the applicant 
shall file an application therefore in writing upon a form furnished for that 
purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with a fee schedule 
adopted by this jurisdiction. In instances where reinspection fees have 
been assessed, additional inspection of the work will not be performed 
until the required fees have been paid.

Subsection 110.5 "Inspection requests" is hereby deleted and replaced in its 
entirety as follows:

110.5  Inspection requests.  It shall be the duty of the person doing the 
work authorized by the permit to notify the Building Official that such 
work is ready for inspection. The Building Official may require that every 
request for inspection be filed at least one working day before such 
inspection is desired. Such request may be requested in writing or by 
telephone at the option of the Building Official. It shall be the duty of the 
person requesting any inspections required by either this Code or the 
technical codes to provide access to and means for inspection of the work.

Section 111 "Certificate of Occupancy" is hereby adopted and amended by 
adding the following subsection:

111.5  Utility release.  The following minimum requirements shall be 
completed prior to any occupancy or utilities connected:

(1) Written clearance from the Fire and Public Works Departments and 
Planning and Business License Divisions.



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 9

(2) The following when applicable:

(a) Electronic imaging of plans received (if required).

(b) Verification of school fees paid.

(c) Grading certificate received.

(d) All plan review fees paid.

(e) Sewer assessment fees paid.

(f) Hazard materials statements received.

(g) Subcontractor's list received.

The following sections of the California Building Code (CBC), are amended as 
follows:

Section 3109.4.1 Barrier height and clearances is amended to read as follows:

The top of the barrier shall be at least 60 inches above grade measured on the side 
of the barrier that faces away from the swimming pool. The maximum vertical 
clearance between grade and the bottom of the barrier shall be 2 inches measured 
on the side of the barrier that faces away from the swimming pool. Where the top 
of the pool structures is above grade, the barrier is authorized to be at ground level 
or mounted on top of the pool structure, and the maximum vertical clearance 
between the top of the pool structure and the bottom of the barrier shall be 4 
inches.

Appendix I Section I104.2 Footings is eliminated in its entirety.

Appendix J Section J103.2 Exception (1) is amended to read:

Grading in an isolated, self-contained area, provided there is no
danger to the public, that such grading will not adversely affect adjoining
properties, and is less than a total of fifty (50) cubic yards (cut and fill).

Section Jll0 Erosion Control is hereby amended by adding:

J 110.3 Stormwater Management and Discharge. All construction
sites are subject to the latest requirements of the City of San Dimas enforced
National Pollution Discharge Elimination System (NPDES), Best Management
Practices (BMPs), and applicable pollution control and erosion protection
measures pursuant to Chapter 14.11 of the San Dimas Municipal Code.



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 10

Section 15.44.010 of the San Dimas Municipal Code is hereby repealed and replaced in 
its entirety as follows:

15.44.010 Adoption.
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Electrical Code, 2016 Edition, 
based on the 2015 National Electrical Code as published by the National Fire 
Protection Association, shall be and become the Electrical Code of the City of San 
Dimas, regulating all installation, arrangement, alteration, repair, use, and other 
operation of electrical wiring, connections, fixtures, and other electrical 
appliances on premises within the City.  The California Electrical Code is on file 
for public examination in the office of the Building Official.

Chapter 15.46 is hereby added to Title 10 ("Buildings and Construction") of the San 
Dimas Municipal Code to read as follows:

Chapter 15.46

GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
Sections:

15.46.010 Adoption.
15.46.020 Green Building Standards Code amendments.

15.46.010 Adoption.
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Green Standards Code, 2016 Edition as 
published by the California Building Standards Commission, shall be and become the 
Green Building Standards Code of the City, regulating and controlling the planning, 
design, operation, use and occupancy of every newly constructed building or structure in 
the City.  The California Green Building Standards Code shall be on file for public 
examination in the office of the Building Official.

15.46.020 Green Building Standards Code amendments.
The 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code is hereby adopted 
with no amendments.

Sections 15.28.010 and 15.28.020 of the San Dimas Municipal Code are hereby repealed 
and replaced in their entirety as follows:

15.28.010  Adoption.
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Mechanical Code, 2016 
Edition, based on the 2015 Uniform Mechanical Code as published by the 
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO), shall 
be and become the Mechanical Code of the City, regulating and controlling the 
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation, and 
maintenance of heating, ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators, 
and other miscellaneous heat-producing appliances.  The California Mechanical 
Code is on file for public examination in the office of the Building Official.



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 11

15.28.020  Mechanical Code amendments.
The 2016 Edition of the California Mechanical Code is hereby adopted with no 
amendments.

Sections 15.48.010 and 15.48.020 of the San Dimas Municipal Code are hereby repealed 
and replaced in their entirety as follows:

15.48.010 Adoption.
Except as provided in this chapter, the California Plumbing Code, 2016 Edition, 
based on the 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code as published by the International 
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO), shall be and 
become the Plumbing Code of the City of San Dimas, regulating erection, 
installation, alteration, repair, relocation, replacement, maintenance, or use of 
plumbing systems within the City.  The California Plumbing Code will be on file 
for public examination in the office of the Building Official.

15.48.020 Plumbing Code amendments.
The 2016 Edition of the California Plumbing Code is adopted with no 
amendments.

Chapter 10.50 is hereby added to Title 15 ("Buildings and Construction") of the San 
Dimas Municipal Code to read as follows:

Chapter 15.50

RESIDENTIAL CODE
Sections:

15.50.010 Adoption.
15.50.020 Residential Code amendments.

15.50.010 Adoption.
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Residential Code, 2016 Edition, based 
on the 2015 International Residential Code, as published by the California Building 
Standards Commission, shall be and become the Residential Building Code of the City, 
regulating construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, 
equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of every 
detached one- and two-family dwelling and townhouse not more than three stories above 
grade in height with a separate means of egress and structures accessory thereto in the 
City.  The California Residential Code will be on file for public examination in the office 
of the Building Official.

10.50.020 Residential Code amendments.
The following portions and sections of Chapter 1, Scope and Application, Division I
"California Administration," and Division II "Administration" are hereby amended as 
follows:



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 12

1.8.4.1 Permits                                                                   

Exception 2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

1.8.8 Appeals Board.  Section 1.8.8 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

1.8.9 Unsafe Buildings or Structures. Section 1.8.9 is hereby deleted in its 
entirety.

Section R105 "Permits" is hereby amended as follows:

Item 9 (fences) under "Building" is hereby amended to read “Fences not over 6 
feet high”.

Item 9 (window awnings) under "Building" is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section R109 "Inspection" is hereby adopted and amended by adding the following 
subsection:

R109.0.1 Workmanship. It is the intention of the City that all construction 
carried on under the review of the Building Division is of good quality.  The 
Building Official shall be empowered to enforce the installation of work that is 
straight, level, plumb, square, etc., as the situation requires.  All work shall be 
well fit and of a durable nature.  Paint in all cases shall not be below normal
standard for the use applied.  The proper grading of walks, drives, and yards shall 
be required when being installed with the work requiring a building permit.  A 
minimum thickness of 3½ inches for flat concrete work and 2 inches for asphalt 
paving shall be required.  All exterior flat concrete work shall include such breaks 
for expansion as deemed necessary by the Building Official.

Subsection R109.1.5 "Other inspections" is hereby amended by adding the following 
language:

A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection when such 
portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or when corrections 
called for are not made.  This section is not to be interpreted as requiring 
reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with the 
requirements of the technical codes but as controlling the practice of calling for 
inspections before the job is ready for such inspection or reinspection. To obtain 
a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefore in writing upon a 
form furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with a 
fee schedule adopted by this jurisdiction.  In instances where reinspection fees 
have been assessed, additional inspection of the work will not be performed until 
the required fees have been paid.



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 13

Chapter 10.51 is hereby added to Title 15 ("Buildings and Construction") of the San 
Dimas Municipal Code to read as follows:

Chapter 15.51

FIRE CODE
Sections:

15.51.010 Adoption.
Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Fire Code, 2016 Edition, based 
on the 2015 International Fire Code, as published by the California Building 
Standards Commission, shall be and become the Fire Code of the City, regulating 
and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards 
arising from the storage, handling, and use of hazardous substances, materials and 
devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of 
buildings and premises in the City. The California Fire Code will be on file for 
public examination in the office of the Building Official.

SEVERABILITY. If any section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase, or 
portion of this Ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the 
decision of any court of competent jurisdication, such decision shall not affect the 
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The City Council hereby declares 
that it would have adopted this Ordinance and each section, subsection, subdivision, 
sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more 
section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof be declared 
invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION X. EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION. This Ordinance shall 
take effect 30 days after its final passage, and within 15 days after its passage the City 
Clerk shall cause it to be published in the Inland Valley Daily Bulletin, a newspaper of 
general circulation (GC§40806) in the City of San Dimas hereby designated for that 
purpose.

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of San 
Dimas this ____ day of _____, 20__.

____________________________________
Curtis W. Morris, Mayor City of San Dimas



Ordinance 1250                                                                                   
Uniform Building Codes Page 14

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

____________________________ _______________________
Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk Mark Steres, City Attorney

I, DEBRA BLACK, ASSISTANT CITY CLERK of the City of San Dimas, do 
hereby certify that Ordinance XXXX was introduced at a regular meeting of the City 
Council of the City of San Dimas on the XX day of XXXX, 20XX, and thereafter passed, 
approved and adopted at a regular meeting of said City Council held on the XX day of 
XXXX, 20XX, by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

___________________________
Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk



6a













































 

          

 
 
 

CITY OF SAN DIMAS PUBLIC FACILITIES 
FINANCING CORPORATION 

TUESDAY, DECEMBER 08, 2015 
SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

245 E. BONITA AVENUE 

 
PRESENT: 
President Curtis W. Morris     Secretary/Treasurer Blaine Michaelis 
Councilmember Emmett Badar     Assistant City Manager Ken Duran 
Councilmember Denis Bertone     City Attorney Mark Steres 
Councilmember John Ebiner     Assistant City Clerk Debra Black 
Councilmember Jeff Templeman 
 
1. CALL TO ORDER 
 
Chairman Morris called the meeting of the San Dimas Public Facilities Financing Corporation to order at 8:46 
p.m.   
 
 
2.   PUBLIC COMMENTS (This is the time set aside for members of the audience to address the Board.  
      Speakers are limited to three minutes.) 
 

No one came forward. 
 
3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES FOR MEETING OF DECEMBER 09, 2014. 
 
MOTION: A Motion was made by Councilmember Ebiner seconded by Councilmember Templeman to approve 
the minutes of December 9, 2014. 
 
For the public’s benefit Mayor Morris asked City Manager Blaine Michaelis to explain the function of the San 
Dimas Public Facilities Finance Corporation. 
 
4. ELECTION OF OFFICERS 
 
Mr. Michaelis provided the explanation and recommended that Curtis Morris be appointed President, Jeff 
Templeman Vice-President and Blaine Michaelis Secretary. 
 
MOTION: A motion was made by Councilmember Bertone, seconded by Councilmember Ebiner to appoint 
Curtis Morris as President, Jeff Templeman as Vice-President and Blaine Michaelis as Secretary. 
 
5. MEMBERS OF THE CORPORATION 
 
 There were no comments. 
 
6. ADJOURNMENT 
 
 Chairman Morris adjourned the meeting at 8:48 p.m.  
 
  
______________________________  ____________________________ 
 Secretary/Treasurer  Debra Black, Assistant City Clerk 

7b



 

             

 
 
 

SAN DIMAS HOUSING AUTHORITY MINUTES 
 TUESDAY, DECEMBER 8, 2015 

SAN DIMAS COUNCIL CHAMBERS 
245 E. BONITA AVENUE 

 
PRESENT: 
Chairman Curtis W. Morris    Executive Director Blaine Michaelis 
Councilmember Emmett Badar    Assistant City Manager Ken Duran 
Councilmember Denis Bertone    City Attorney Mark Steres 
Councilmember John Ebiner   Assistant City Clerk Debra Black 
Councilmember Templeman 
 
CALL TO ORDER 
 
Chairman Morris called the meeting to order at 8:48 p.m. 
 
PUBLIC COMMENTS (This is the time set aside for members of the audience to address the Board.  Speakers 
are limited to three minutes.) 
 
No one came forward. 
 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES  
 

a. Approval of Minutes from December 9, 2014 
 
MOTION: A motion was made by Councilmember Bertone, seconded by Councilmember Ebiner to approve the 
minutes of December 9, 2014. The motion carried unanimously. (5-0) 
 

a. Submittal of the San Dimas Housing Authority Annual Audit and Annual Report for FY 14-15 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Receive and file both reports. 
 
Assistant City Manager Ken Duran presented staff’s report on these items. 
 
MOTION: A motion was made by Councilmember Badar, seconded by Councilmember Templeman receive and 
file the Annual Audit  and Annual Report for FY 14-15. The motion carried by five to zero vote. (5-0) 
 

b. Approval of Administrative Services Agreement between the City of San Dimas and the Housing 
Authority. 

 
MOTION: A motion was made by Councilmember Bertone, seconded by Councilmember Ebiner to approve the 
Administrative Agreement with estimated cost of reimbursement of $65,500 for this current fiscal year. 
  
MEMBERS OF THE AUTHORITY 
No comments made. 
 
Chairman Morris adjourned the meeting of the San Dimas Housing Authority at 8:52 p.m. and reconvened the 
regular meeting of the San Dimas City Council. 
 
 
________________________  ______________________________ 
Chairman  Assistant City Clerk 

8b



8c

























8d









8e































9b(2)















 

 
 

Agenda Item Staff Report 

 
 
To: Honorable Mayor and Members of City Council  
 For the meeting of December 13, 2016  
 
From: Blaine Michaelis, City Manager 
 
Subject: Reappoint Public Safety Commissioners to another term 
   
______________________________________________________________________  
  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Pleasure of the council. 
 

 
SUMMARY 

Commissioners Kevin Burke and Josh Hibbard 
are eligible to be appointed to serve an 

additional 2 year term on the Public Safety 
Commission.  They are both interested in 

continuing their service on the Commission. 

9d(1)


	December 13th 2016 Regular City Council Meeting  Agenda
	3a. Resolution 2016-58 November December 2016 Warrant Registers
	3b. November 22, 2016 Study Session Minutes
	3c. Construction Contract 2016-03 Via Verde Park Improvement
	Letter and Attachments to Principles 11162016
	Principles Contracting License Info 11082016

	Letter to Bruns - Response to Non-responsible Letter - request for hearing

	3d. Administrative Services Agreement
	4a. MCTA 16-01
	Ordinance 1251 MCTA 16-01 - Copy
	EXHIBIT A
	1. Delete the text with the strike-throughs and add the text shown in red.
	Chapter 18.38  SECOND ACCESSORY DWELLING UNITS
	18.38.010 Purpose.
	18.38.020 Permitted uses.

	18.38.030 General provisions.
	18.38.040 Development standards.
	18.38.050 Plan review.
	18.38.060 Appeals.

	PC-1570 MCTA 16-01 ADUs
	MCTA 16-01 ADUs Staff Rpt 11-17-16
	Exhibit A  SB-1069
	Exhibit B  AB-2299
	Exhibit C  AB-2406

	5b. SDMC 8.40 Residency Restrictions Registered Sex Offenders Staff Report
	Ordinance 1252 Sex Offender Residency Restriction
	5c. Uniform Buidling Codes Amendments
	Ordinance 1250 Uniform Building Code
	6a. Historic Tax Credit Program Closure
	7b. San Dimas Public Facilities Financing Corporation Minutes 2015
	8b. San Dimas Housing Authority Minutes 2015
	8c. San Dimas Housing Authority Annual Audit and Housing Succesor Annual Report
	8d. Administrative Services Agreement
	8e. Annual Audit Charter Oak Mobile Home Community
	9b(2) Grove Station and Village Walk Homeowners Ass. Staff Response
	9d(1). Reappointments to Public Safety



